Eleventh Parliament Third Session

(No. 066) (534)

REPUBLIC OF KENYA

ELEVENTH PARLIAMENT — (THIRD SESSION)

THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY
ORDERS OF THE DAY

TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 AT 2.30 P.M.

ORDER OF BUSINESS

PRAYERS

Administration of Oath
Communication from the Chair
Messages

Petitions

Papers

Notices of Motion

Statements

8*. THE COUNTY ALLOCATION OF REVENUE BILL (SENATE BILL NO.05

OF 2015)
(The Chairperson, Budget and Appropriations Committee)

NoO kWD

First Reading

9*. MOTION - NINETEENTH REPORT OF THE PUBLIC INVESTMENTS
COMMITTEE
(The Chairperson, Public Investments Committee)

THAT, this House adopts the Nineteenth Report of the Public Investments
Committee on the Audited Financial Statements of State Corporations (Volume | & II),
laid on the Table of the House on Tuesday, 31° March, 2015.

(Question to be put)

10*. MOTION - THE REPORT ON LAND ISSUES IN TAITATAVETA COUNTY
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Lands)

THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Departmental Committee on Lands on
Land issues in Taita Taveta County, laid on the Table of the House on Thursday, 25" June,
2015.

11*. THE PRIVATE SECURITY REGULATION BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY
BILL NO. 4 OF 2014)

(The Leader of the Majority Party)

Second Reading



(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (535)

12*, THE SPECIAL ECONOMIC ZONESBILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL
NO. 6 OF 2015)
(The Leader of the Majority Party)

Second Reading

13* MOTION - THE ADOPTION OF SESSIONAL PAPERS NOS. 3 AND 4 OF 2013
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Labour and Social Welfare)

THAT, this House adopts the Sessional Papers Nos. 3 and 4 of 2013 on the National
Productivity Policy, and the Employment Policy and Strategy for Kenya respectively, laid
on the Table of the House on Wednesday, July 17, 2013.

14*, MOTION - THE ADOPTION OF SESSIONAL PAPER NO. 2 OF 2013
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Labour and Social Welfare)

THAT, this House adopts the Sessional Paper No. 2 of 2013 on the National Industrial
Training and Attachment Policy, laid on the Table of the House on December 3, 2013.

15*. MOTION - THE ADOPTION OF SESSIONAL PAPER NO. 5 OF 2014
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Administration and National
Security)

THAT, this House adopts the Sessional Paper No. 5 of 2014 on the National Policy
for Peacebuilding and Conflict Management, laid on the Table of the House on Thursday,
July 31, 2014.

16*. MOTION - THE ADOPTION OF SESSIONAL PAPER NO. 2 OF 2014
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Labour and Social Welfare)

THAT, this House adopts the Sessional Paper No. 2 of 2014 on the National Social
Protection Policy, laid on the Table of the House on Tuesday, June 17, 2014.

17*. MOTION - THE ADOPTION OF SESSIONAL PAPER NO. 4 OF 2014
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs)

THAT, this House adopts the Sessional Paper No. 4 of 2014 on the Governance,
Justice, Law and Order Sector (GJLOS) Policy, laid on the Table of the House on
Thursday, February 12, 2015.



(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (536)

18*. MOTION - THE ADOPTION OF SESSIONAL PAPER NO. 9 OF 2013
(The Chairperson, Joint Committee on National Cohesion and Equal
Opportunity)

THAT, this House adopts the Sessional Paper No. 9 of 2013 on the National
Cohesion and Integration, laid on the Table of the House on Thursday, July 31, 2014.

* Denotes Orders of the Day

N O T 1 C E S

I. THE SECURITIES AND INVESTMENT ANALYSTS BILL
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 21 OF 2014)

(i) Notice is given that the Chairperson of the Departmental Committee on
Finance, Planning and Trade, intends to move the following amendments to the
Securities and Investments Analysts Bill, 2014 at the Committee Stage—

CLAUSE 1
THAT, clause 1 be amended by deleting the words “Securities and Investment” and substituting
therefor the words “Investment and Financial”.

CLAUSE 2
THAT, clause 2 be amended—
(a) in subclause (1),—

(1) by deleting the definition of “ Disciplinary Board™;

(i) in the definition of “Institute”, by deleting the words “Securities and Investments” and
substituting therefor the words “Investment and Financial”;

(iii) by deleting the definition “Registration Board”;
(iv) by inserting the following new definitions in their proper alphabetical sequence—
“Disciplinary Committee” means the Committee established under section 27,

“Registration Committee” means the registration and quality assurance
committee established under section13 of this Act;”

(b) in subclause (2), by inserting the words “if he does not seek registration or” immediately after
the words “not registered” in paragraph (a).



(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (537)

CLAUSE 3
THAT, clause 3 be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the words “Securities and Investment” and
substituting therefor the words “Investment and Financial”.

CLAUSE 4
THAT, clause 4 be amended—
(a) in subclause (1), by—
(i) deleting the word “is” appearing after the word “registered” and substituting therefor the
words “under section 16 of this Act as”;

(ii) deleting the acronym “I1A” and substituting therefor “FA™;
(b) in subclause (2),—

() paragraph (a), by—
a. deleting the words “Securities and Investment” and substituting therefor the
words “Investment and Financial”;

b. deleting the acronym “FCSIA” and substituting therefor “FCIFA”;

(i) paragraph (b), by—
a. deleting the words “Securities and Investment” and substituting therefor the
words “Investment and Financial”;

b. deleting the acronym “CSIA” and substituting therefor “CIFA”;

(iii) paragraph (c), by—
a. deleting the words “Securities and Investment” and substituting therefor the
words “Investment and Financial”;

b. deleting the acronym “ACSIA” and substituting therefor “ACIFA”;

CLAUSE 6
THAT, clause 6 be amended—
(@ in sub clause (1) by deleting the words “securities and investments” and substituting
therefor the words “investment and financial analysts profession”;

(b) insub clause (3) by—
(i)  deleting the words “Securities and Investments” and substituting therefor the words
“Investment and Financial™;
(i) by deleting the phrase Hon FCSIA” and substituting therefor the phrase* Hon
FCIFA”.
CLAUSE 7
THAT, clause 7 be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the word “matter” before the word
“provided” and substituting therefor with the word “manner”.

CLAUSE 8
THAT, clause 8 be amended—

(a) by deleting paragraph (a);

(b) in paragraph (b) by inserting the word “ethical” before the word “practice”;



(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (538)

(c) in paragraph (e) by deleting the words “financial, securities and investments” and substituting
therefor the words “investment and financial”;

(d) in paragraph (g) by inserting the words “ and integrity” immediately after the word “ethics”.

CLAUSE 10
THAT, clause 10 (1) be amended by deleting the word "boards” and substituting therefor the word
“committees”.

CLAUSE 12
THAT, clause 12 be amended by inserting the following new subclause immediately after subclause

(1)—
“(1A) The Secretary shall be the Chief executive officer of the Institute.”

CLAUSE 13
THAT, clause 13 be amended—
(a) in subclause (1), by—
(i) deleting the word “board” and substituting therefor the word “committee”;
(i) deleting the words “ Registration and Quality Assurance Board” and substituting
therefor the words “Registration Committee”;
(b) in subclause (2), by—
(i) deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word “Committee”;

(i) inserting the word “for” immediately after the word “responsible” appearing in
paragraph (b);

(c) in subclause (3), by—
(i)  deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word “Committee”;

(i)  deleting the words “financial securities and investments” and substituting therefor
the words “investment and financial in paragraph (a);

(d) in subclause (4) by deleting the word *“Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;

(e) in subclause (5) by deleting the word *“Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;

(f) in subclause (6) by deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting therefor
the word “Committee”;

(9) in subclause (7) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee”;

(h) in subclause (8) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee”;



(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (539)

() in subclause (9) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee”;

(j) in subclause (10) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee”;

CLAUSE 14
THAT, clause 14 be amended—

(a) in subclause (1), by—

(i) deleting the words “ financial, securities and investment” and substituting therefor
the words “investment and financial” ;
(i)  deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word “Committee”;

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the words “ financial, securities and investment” and substituting
therefor the words “ investment and financial”;

(c) in subclause (3) by deleting the word *“ Board” and substituting therefor the word “
Committee™;

(d) in subclause (5) by deleting the words “one million” and substituting therefor the words
“two hundred thousand”.

CLAUSE 15
THAT, clause 15 be amended—
(@) in subclause (1) by deleting the words “financial, securities and investment” and substituting
therefor the words “ investment and financial”;

(b) by deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting therefor the word
“Committee”.

CLAUSE 16
THAT, clause 16 be amended—
(a) in subclause (1)—
(i) by deleting the words “securities and investment” and substituting therefor the words
“investment and financial”;
(i) by inserting the following new paragraph immediately after paragraph (b)—

“(c) has satisfied the requirements of Chapter Six of the Constitution;”
(b) in subclause (3), by—

(i) deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting therefor the word
“Committee”™;
(i) deleting the words *“ financial, securities and investment “in paragraph (b) and
substituting therefor the words “ investment and financial”.
CLAUSE 17
THAT, clause 17 be amended—
(@) insubclause (1) by—
() inserting the following new paragraphs immediately after paragraph (c) in subclause

(1)—



(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (540)

“(ca) if such person does not meet the requirements of Chapter Six of the
Constitution;
(cb) if such person sits and fails the annual ethics and integrity test administered
by the Institute;”
(i) deleting the word “Board” in paragraph (d) and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;

(b) in subclause (2), by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;

(c) in subclause (3), by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;

CLAUSE 18

THAT, clause 18 be amended by—
(a) deleting the word “Board” in subclause (1) and substituting therefor the word “Committee”;
(b) deleting the word “Board” in subclause (2) and substituting therefor the word “Committee”;
(c) deleting the word “Board” in subclause (6) and substituting therefor the word “Committee”;

CLAUSE 19
THAT, clause 19 be amended by—
(a) deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;
(b) inserting the following new paragraph immediately after paragraph (c) in subclause (1)—

“(d) if such person does not meet the requirements of Chapter Six of the Constitution;

CLAUSE 20
THAT, clause 20 be amended in subclause (1), by—

@ deleting the words “ financial, securities and investment” and substituting therefor the
words “ investment and financial’”;
(b) deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word “Committee”.

CLAUSE 21
THAT, clause 21 be amended—

(@) by deleting the phrase “financial, securities and investment” wherever it occurs and
substituting therefor the phrase * investment and financial”;
(b) in subclause (1) by deleting the word “securities” appearing in paragraph (c).

CLAUSE 22
THAT, clause 22 be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the word *“Board” and substituting
therefor the word “Committee”.

CLAUSE 23
THAT, clause 23 be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the word *“Board” and substituting
therefor the word “Committee”.



(N0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (541)

CLAUSE 24
THAT, clause 24 be amended by deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting
therefor the word “Committee”.

CLAUSE 26
THAT, clause 26 be amended in subclause (1)—
(a) by deleting the words “securities, financial and investment” and substituting therefor the
words “ investment and financial’”;

(b) by deleting paragraph (p) and substituting therefor the following paragraph—

“(p) is an employee of an institution whose license is granted under the Capital
Markets Act or any applicable law in Kenya and fails to keep the funds of a client in a
separate account or fails to use such funds for purposes for which they are intended.”

CLAUSE 27
THAT, clause 27 be amended—
(@) in subclause (1) by deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting therefor
the word “Committee”;
(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the word *“Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;

(c) in subclause (3)—

(i) in paragraph (a) by—
a.  deleting the word “four” and substituting therefor the word “three”;

b. inserting the words “who meets the minimum qualifications of a full member of the
Institute in good standing with at least ten years’ experience in the profession,”
immediately after the word * chairperson”;

(i) by deleting paragraph (d) and substituting therefor the following new paragraph—

“(d) one nominated by the Institute of Certified Public Secretaries of Kenya;”
(iii) by inserting the following new paragraphs immediately after paragraph (d)—

“(e) one nominated by the Capital Markets Authority;
(f) one nominated by the cabinet Secretary in charge of the National Treasury.”
(d) in subclause (5) by deleting the word *“Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;
(e) in subclause (6) by deleting the word *“Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;
(f) in subclause (7) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;
(g) in subclause (8) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;
(h) in subclause (9) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;



(N0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (542)

CLAUSE 29
THAT, clause 29 be amended—

(a) in subclause (1), by—
(i) deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word “Committee
(i) deleting the words “one hundred” paragraph (f) and substituting therefor the words

“five hundred”.

(b) in subclause (2) by deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting therefor
the word “Committee”;

(c) in subclause (3) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;

(d) in subclause (4) by deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting therefor
the word “Committee”;

(e) in subclause (5) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;

(f) in subclause (6) by deleting the word “Board” and substituting therefor the word
“Committee™;

CLAUSE 30
THAT, clause 30 be amended by deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting
therefor the word “Committee”.

CLAUSE 31
THAT, clause 31 be amended by deleting the words “securities and investment” and substituting
therefor the words “investment and financial”.

NEW PART
THAT, the Bill be amended by introducing a new PART IVA- FINANCIAL PROVISIONS
Immediately after Part IV.

PART IVA— FINANCIAL PROVISIONS

Funds of the Institute 31 A The funds of the Institute shall consist of —

(a) such fees, monies or assets as may accrue to or vest in the Institute
in the course of the exercise of its powers or the performance of
its functions under this Act or under any other written law;

(b) such gifts as may be given to the Institute; and

(c) all monies from any other source provided for or donated to the

Institute.

Financial year 31B. Unless otherwise provided, the financial year of the Institute shall be
the period for twelve months ending on the thirty-first day of December
in each year.

Annual estimates 31C. (1) At least three months before the commencement of each

financial year, the Institute shall cause to be prepared estimates of
revenue and expenditure for that year.

(2) The annual estimates shall be approved by the Council before the
commencement of the financial year to which they relate.

(3) The Council shall cause to be kept all proper books and records of
accounts of the income, expenditure and assets of the Institute.

(4) Within a period of four months from the end of each financial year,
the Council shall submit to its auditors the accounts of the Institute for
audit.



(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (543)

(5) Within six months before the end of the financial year, the Council
shall lay the audited accounts before the annual general meeting of its
members together with any reports made by the auditors.

CLAUSE 34
THAT, clause 34 of the Bill be deleted.

CLAUSE 35
THAT, clause 35 be amended—
(a) in subclause (1) by deleting the words “Securities and Investment” wherever they occur and
substituting therefor the words “Investment and Financial”;

(b) in subclause (4) by deleting the word “five” and substituting therefor the word “one”.

CLAUSE 39
THAT, clause 39 be amended by deleting the words “Securities and Investment” and substituting
therefor the words “Investment and Financial”.

FIRST SCHEDULE
THAT, the First Schedule be amended in paragraph 1 by deleting subparagraph (3) and substituting
therefor the following new subparagraph—

“(3) A person who holds the office of chairperson is not eligible for re- election until after the
expiry of a period of at least two years since he or she vacated the office.”

THIRD SCHEDULE
THAT, the Third Schedule of the Bill be amended-

(a) in the heading by deleting the words “ REGISTRATION AND QUALITY ASSURANCE
BOARD?” and substituting therefor the words “REGISTRATION COMMITTEE”;

(b) by deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting therefor the word
“Committee”.

FOURTH SCHEDULE
THAT, the Fourth Schedule of the Bill be amended-

(@) in the heading by deleting the words “DISCIPLINARY BOARD” and substituting therefor
the words “DISCIPLINARY COMMITTEE”;

(b) by deleting the word “Board” wherever it occurs and substituting therefor the word
“Committee”.

FIFTH SCHEDULE
THAT, the Fifth Schedule of the Bill be amended by deleting the words “securities and investment”
and substituting therefor the words “investment and financial” in paragraph 1.

LONGTITLE
THAT, the long title of the Bill be amended by deleting the words “Securities and Investment”
wherever they occur and substituting therefor the words “Investment and Financial”.




(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (544)

TITLETOTHE BILL
THAT, the title of the Bill be amended by deleting the words “SECURITIES AND
INVESTMENTS” and substituting therefor the words “INVESTMENT AND FINANCIAL”.

(i) Notice is given that the Leader of the Majority Party (The Hon. Aden Duale),
intends to move the following amendments to the Securities and Investments
Analysts Bill, 2014 at the Committee Stage—

CLAUSE 2
THAT, clause 2 be amended in subclause (2), by inserting the words “if he does not seek
registration or” immediately after the words “not registered” in paragraph (b).

CLAUSE 6
THAT, clause 6 be amended in sub clause (1) by inserting the word “profession” immediately after
the words “securities and investments”.

CLAUSE 8
THAT, clause 8 be amended by deleting paragraph (a).

CLAUSE 13
THAT, clause 13 be amended in subclause (2), by inserting the following new paragraph
Immediately after paragraph (d)—

“(da) one person nominated by the Capital Markets Authority”;
CLAUSE 20
THAT clause 20 be amended by inserting the following new subclauses immediately after subclause
(1)—
“(1A) A person who is a certified professional and holds a valid certificate from a recognized
certifying body shall be exempt from the requirements of practicing as a certified financial,
securities and investment analyst set out in subsection (1).

(1B) The Cabinet Secretary shall make regulations for the better carrying out of this section.”

CLAUSE 21

THAT, clause 21 (2) be amended by deleting the words “does not practice as a financial, securities
and investment analysts by reason only of carrying on the work of an investment consultant or an
investment advisor of a financial consultant” and substituting therefor the words “may only
undertake the work of an investment consultant or investment advisor or a financial consultant in
the course of practicing their profession.”



(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (545)

CLAUSE 26
THAT, clause 26 be amended by deleting paragraph (p) and substituting therefor the following new
paragraph—

“(p) is an employee of an institution whose license is granted under the Capital Markets Act
and licensing regulations, permits handling of client’s funds, fails to keep the funds of a client
In a separate banking account or to use such funds for purposes for which they are
intended.”

CLAUSE 27
THAT, clause 27 be amended in subclause (3) by inserting a new paragraph immediately after
paragraph (d)—

“(e) one nominated by the Capital Markets Authority;

CLAUSE 29
THAT, clause 29 be amended in subclause (1) paragraph (f) by deleting the words “one hundred
thousand” and substituting therefor the words “one million”.

CLAUSE 32
THAT, clause 32 be amended by deleting the words “Examinations Board” wherever they occur
and substituting therefor the words “Registration Board”.

CLAUSE 34

THAT, clause 34 be amended by deleting the word “Examinations Board” wherever they occur and
substituting therefor the words “Registration Board”.

................ /Notices (cont’d)



(No0.066) TUESDAY, JUNE 30, 2015 (546)

The House resolved on Wednesday, February 11, 2015 as follows:-

THAT, notwithstanding the provisions of Standing Order 97(4), each speech in a debate
on Bills sponsored by a Committee, the Leader of the Majority Party or the Leader
of the Minority Party shall be limited as follows:- A maximum of fourty five (45) minutes
for the Mover, in moving and fifteen minutes (15) in replying, a maximum of thirty (30)
minutes for the Chairperson of the relevant Committee (if the Bill is not sponsored by the
relevant Committee), and a maximum of ten (10) minutes for any other Member speaking,
except the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party, who shall be
limited to a maximum of fifteen Minutes (15) each (if the Bill is not sponsored by either of
them); and that priority in speaking shall be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party,
the Leader of the Minority Party and the Chairperson of the relevant Departmental
Committee, in that Order.

THAT, notwithstanding the provisions of Standing Order 97(4), each speech in a debate
on any Motion, including a Special motion shall be limited in the following manner:- A
maximum of three hours with not more than twenty (20) minutes for the Mover and ten
(10) minutes for each other Member speaking, except the Leader of the Majority Party and
the Leader of the Minority Party, who shall be limited to a maximum of fifteen (15)
minutes each, and that ten (10) minutes before the expiry of the time, the Mover shall be
called upon to reply; and that priority in speaking be accorded to the Leader of the
Majority Party, the Leader of the Minority Party and the Chairperson of the relevant
Departmental Committee, in that Order.

................. /Notice Paper



NOTICE PAPER

Tentative business for

Wednesday (Morning), July 01, 2015

(Published pursuant to Standing Order 38(1)

It is notified that the House Business Committee, at their last meeting, approved the following
tentative business to appear in the Order Paper for Wednesday (Morning), June 01, 2015:-

A. MOTION -

ESTABLISHMENT OF INTENSIVE CARE & BLOOD

B. MOTION -

TRANSFUSION UNITS IN EVERY CONSTITUENCY
(The Hon. Abdul Rahim Dawood, M.P.)

(Resumption of debate interrupted on Wednesday, June 24, 2015 - Morning Sitting)

(Balance of time — I hr. 23 mins)

PERIOD OF SERVICE FOR POLICE OFFICERS UPON

C. MOTION -

COMPLETION OF SPECIALIZED TRAINING
(The Hon. John Waluke, M.P.)

DECLARATION OF CATTLE RUSTLING AS A NATIONAL

D. MOTION -

DISASTER & ESTABLISHMENT OF A SPECIAL FUND FOR
VICTIMS
(The Hon. William Cheptumo, M.P.)

FIREARMS TRACKING AND REGISTRATION SYSTEM

E. MOTION -

(The Hon. (Dr.) Victor Munyaka, M.P.)

DEVELOPMENT AND IMPLEMENTATION OF A NATIONAL

CURRICULUM FOR EMERGENCY TRAINING OF MEDICAL
PERSONNEL
(The Hon. (Dr.) Susan Musyoka, MP)

.............. /Appendix



APPENDIX

THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

SCHEDULE of Questions for
Tuesday, June 30, 2015

It is notified that, pursuant to Standing Orders 191 and 216, the Cabinet Secretaries for
Transport and Infrastructure; Labour, Social Security and Services; and Education, Science and
Technology; will appear before the following Departmental Committees on Tuesday, June 30,
2015 at the times hereunder:-

Departmental Committee Cabinet Secretary Time Venue
(i) Transport, Public Cabinet Secretary for 10.00 - 11.30 am The National
Works and Housing Transport and Infrastructure Assembly
Chamber
(i) Labour and Social Cabinet Secretary for Labour, 11.30am —12.30pm  The National
Welfare Social Security and Services Assembly
Chamber
(i) Education, Research  Cabinet Secretary for 11.30am - 1230 pmM 4o pjini.
and Technology Education, Science and Chamber,
Technology County Hall

The Committees’ Agenda has been determined as follows-

AGENDA
(Published pursuant to Standing Order 170E (2)

1. Prayers

2. Communication from the Chairperson(s)

I. Questions under the Departmental Committee on Transport, Public Works and
Housing

Questions to the Cabinet Secretary for Transport and Infrastructure:-

(i) Question By Private Notice, No. PVT/ 01/2015 by the Member for Kikuyu
Constituency (The Hon. Kimani Ichung’'wah, M.P.):-
Considering that Article 236(b) of the Constitution provides that a public officer shall
not be dismissed, removed from office, demoted in rank or otherwise subjected to
disciplinary action without due process of law, could the Cabinet Secretary inform the



(if)

Committee whether he is aware that a number employees of the Kenya Airports
Authority (KAA) were suspended without following the due process contrary to the
above provisions; whether the Ministry is aware that the move is likely to expose the
Government to unnecessary litigation; and the measures the Ministry has taken to
address the same?

Questions Nos. 02372015 and 029/2015 by the Member for Embakasi South
Constituency (The Hon. Irshadali M. Sumra, M.P. and Member for Mbooni
Constituency (The Hon. Kisoi Munyao, M.P.) respectively:-

Could the Cabinet Secretary inform the Committee on measures in place towards ensuring
that road contractors complete their works within the scheduled timelines, and in particular
brief Members on reasons behind the delayed completion of Outering Road
(Embakasi), and the tarmacking of Tawa-Kikima-Kyambalasi Roads (Mbooni), and the
plans put in place by the Ministry to ensure the speedy completion of the said Roads
and the expected completion date.

(iii) Question No. 026/2015 by the Member for Kibra Constituency (Hon. Ken Okoth

M.P.):-

Could the Cabinet Secretary inform the Committee the mechanisms in place to enhance
the welfare of staff in agencies under the Ministry of Transport and Infrastructure, and in
particular, the steps being undertaken by the Government to safeguard the Kenya Railways
Pension Scheme beneficiaries from irregular and fraudulent disposal, leasing and allocation
of their property?

Questions under the Departmental Committee on Labour and Social Welfare

Questions to the Cabinet Secretary for Labour, Social Security and Services:

Question No. 03672015 by the Member for Rabai Constituency (The Hon. Kamoti
W. Mwamkale M.P.):-

Could the Cabinet Secretary inform the Committee the observance of workers’ rights to
fair labour practices as provided for in Article 41 of the Constitution in Export
Processing Zones (EPZs) in the Country in particular, by the Hantex Garments
Company, an EPZ affiliate located in Mazeras, Rabai Constituency; the maximum
working hours per day; the average minimum wage for workers vis-a-vis the gazetted
minimum rate provided for in Legal Notice No. 197 of 2013; and the action by the
Government to ensure respect for workers’ rights and entitlements in EPZ companies.



(i) Question No. 08472015 by the Member for Mwingi Central Constituency (The
Hon. Joe Musyimi Mutambu, M.P.):-

Considering that the Government launched a social protection plan to enable elderly
citizens aged above 65 years to receive Ksh 2,000 per month for upkeep in line with
Article 57(d) of the Constitution, could the Cabinet Secretary confirm to the
Committee whether the stipend is being disbursed fairly or not; provide the statistics
of the programme’s current coverage vis-a-vis the population of older members across
the country, and measures the Ministry is putting in place to ensure that all deserving
and eligible members of the society across the country benefit from the funding?

I11. Questions under the Departmental Committee on Education, Research and
Technology

Questions to the Cabinet Secretary for Education, Science and Technology:

(i) Question By Private Notice No. PVT/7/2014 by the Member for Nyeri Town
Constituency (The Hon. Esther Murugi Mathenge, M.P.):-
Could the Cabinet Secretary apprise the Committee on the circumstances
surrounding persistent students’ unrest at the Dedan Kimathi University of Science
and Technology and whether there are plans to reinstate all students who were
suspended or expelled on 2" October 2014?

(i) Question No. 057/2015 by the Member for Wajir South Constituency (The Hon.
Abdullahi M. Diriye, M.P.): -
Could the Cabinet Secretary apprise the Committee on the criteria being adopted by the
Kenya Universities and Colleges Central Placement Service’s Placement Board in
promoting affirmative action; the criteria the Board uses in admitting students from
marginalized areas, the minorities and those with disabilities; and explain the reasons
why the Board does not admit government-sponsored students to private universities
and colleges?

(ili) Question No. 05872015 by the Member for Bomet Central Constituency (The
Hon. Ronald Tonui, M.P.):-
Could the Cabinet Secretary brief the Committee on the reasons Members why
Polytechnics have not yet been transferred to counties; reasons behind failure to pay
polytechnic tutors and instructors for the last two years; the expected timelines for
paying them their remuneration and arrears; and the measures being pursued in
devolving polytechnics?




