
Thirteenth Parliament                Fourth Session 
                 Afternoon Sitting  
 
(No. 20)                                  (412) 
 

 

 
REPUBLIC OF KENYA 

 
THIRTEENTH PARLIAMENT – (FOURTH SESSION) 

 
THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY 

 
ORDERS OF THE DAY 

  
THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025 AT 2.30 P.M. 

 
 

ORDER OF BUSINESS 
 

PRAYERS 
 

1. Administration of Oath 

2. Communication from the Chair 

3. Messages 

4. Petitions 

5. Papers 

6. Notices of Motion  

7. Questions and Statements 
 

8*. MOTION – REPORT OF THE COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE  
    HOUSE ON THE NATIONAL LAND COMMISSION  
    (AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL  
    NO. 43 OF 2023) 

    (The Hon. Owen Baya, M.P.) 

THAT, this House do agree with the Report of the Committee of the Whole 
House on its consideration of the National Land Commission (Amendment) Bill 
(National Assembly Bill No. 43 of 2023). 

 

   (Question to be put and Third Reading) 

 

9*. COMMITTEE OF THE WHOLE HOUSE 
 

(i) The Supplementary Appropriation Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 8 of 2025) 
(The Chairperson, Liaison Committee) 
 

(ii) The County Governments Additional Allocations Bill (National Assembly Bill 
No. 2 of 2025) 
(The Leader of the Majority Party) 

 (If not concluded on Thursday, March 13, 2024 – Morning Sitting) 

.….……../9*(Cont’d) 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (413) 

 
(iii) The Public Finance Management (Amendment) (No. 2) Bill (National Assembly 

Bill No. 26 of 2024) 
(The Leader of the Majority Party) 
 

(iv) The Insurance Professionals Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 13 of 2024) 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Finance and National Planning) 
 
 

10*. MOTION – PUBLIC PETITION ON LEGAL RECOGNITION AND 
PROTECTION OF E-HAILING MOTORCYCLE RIDERS 
AND DELIVERY PERSONNEL 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Transport and 
Infrastructure) 

 
THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Departmental Committee on 

Transport and Infrastructure on its consideration of Public Petition No. 14 of 2024 
regarding Legal Recognition and Protection of E-Hailing Motorcycle Riders and 
Delivery Personnel, laid on the Table of the House on Thursday, 20th February 2025. 

 

(Resumption of debate interrupted on Thursday, March 6, 2025) 

(Balance of time – 2 hours 8 minutes) 

 
11*. MOTION – STATE OF SECURITY IN SIX COUNTIES OF NORTH 

RIFT BEING, BARINGO, ELGEYO MARAKWET, 
TURKANA, WEST POKOT, SAMBURU AND LAIKIPIA 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Administration and 
Internal Security) 
 

THAT, this House adopts the Report of the Departmental Committee on 
Administration and Internal Security on the inquiry into the state of security in six 
counties of North Rift of Baringo, Elgeyo Marakwet, Turkana, West Pokot, Samburu 
and Laikipia, declared as disturbed, laid on the Table of the House on Tuesday, 13th August 
2024. 

 (If not concluded on Thursday, March 13, 2024 – Morning Sitting) 

 
12*. THE LEARNERS WITH DISABILITIES BILL (SENATE BILL NO. 4 OF 

2023) 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Education) 
 
 

      Second Reading 
 

 (If not concluded on Thursday, March 13, 2024 – Morning Sitting) 

 
 
 
 

.….……../13* 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (414) 

 

13*. THE TREATY MAKING AND RATIFICATION (AMENDMENT) (No.2) 
BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 9 OF 2024) 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs) 
 

Second Reading 

 

 (If not concluded on Thursday, March 13, 2024 – Morning Sitting) 

 
 
 
 
 

       

        *Denotes Orders of the Day* 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

.….……../Notices*(Cont’d) 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (415) 

 

N O T I C E S 

I. THE SUPPLEMENTARY APPROPRIATION BILL, 

2025 (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 8 OF 

2025) 

Notice is given that the Chairperson of the Liaison Committee intends to move 
the following amendments to the Supplementary Appropriation Bill, 2025 
(National Assembly Bills No. 8 of 2025) at the Committee Stage— 
 

CLAUSE 2  

THAT, Clause 2 of the Bill be amended by deleting the expression “one hundred and 

twenty-two billion, four hundred and twenty eighty million, nine hundred and seventy-

four thousand, four hundred and nineteen shillings” appearing before the words “the 

sum of” and substituting therefor the expression, “one hundred and forty-three billion 

one hundred and eighty-four million, four hundred and seventy-three thousand, nine 

hundred and three shillings.” 

 

CLAUSE  5 

THAT, the Bill be amended by deleting clause 5 and substituting therefor the following 

new clause— 

  

“The supply granted for the services of the year ending on 30th June, 2025, in 

respect of  Votes  R1014, R1016, R1054, R1091, R1112, R1162, R1173, R1203, 

R1212, R1311, R2031, R2061, D1032, D1065, D1071, D1094, D1104, D1109, 

D1112, D1122, D1135, D1162, D1175, D1176, D1177, D1185, D1212, D1261, 

D1332 and D2141, in accordance with the Appropriation Act, 2024, is reduced 

by the amounts specified in the third column of the Second Schedule.” 

 

FIRST SCHEDULE 

THAT, the First Schedule to the Bill be deleted and replaced with the following new 

Schedule— 

FIRST SCHEDULE 

(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid  

Recurrent Expenditure 
  

R1011 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Executive 
Office of the President in the following 
programmes 

906,688,041 - 

 
0603000 Government Printing Services 105,649,533 - 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid  

0701000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

618,038,508 - 

 
0703000 Government Advisory Services (72,000,000) -  
0770000 Leadership and Coordination of 
Government Services 

255,000,000 - 

R1012 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Office of 
the Deputy President in the following 
programmes 

420,400,000 - 

 
0734000 Deputy President Services 420,400,000 - 

R1013 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Office of 
the Prime Cabinet Secretary in the following 
programmes 

168,400,000 - 

 
0755000 Government Coordination and Supervision 168,400,000 - 

R1015 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Performance and Delivery 
Management in the following programmes 

124,900,000 - 

 
0762000 Public Service Performance Management 21,200,000 -  
0764000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

96,200,000 - 

 
0772000 Service Delivery Management 4,000,000 -  
077300 Cordination and Supervison of Government 3,500,000 - 

R1017 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
House in the following programmes 

3,659,488,392 - 

 
0704000 State House Affairs 3,659,488,392 - 

R1023 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Correctional Services in the 
following programmes 

1,362,340,545 - 

 
0623000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

30,000,000 - 

 
0627000 Prison Services 1,084,245,442 -  
0628000 Probation & After Care Services 248,095,103 - 

R1024 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Immigration and Citizen Services 
in the following programmes 

424,909,689 2,722,453,780 

 
0605000 Migration & Citizen Services 83,916,356 2,722,453,780  
0626000 Population Management Services 215,993,333 -  
0631000 General Administration and Planning 125,000,000 - 

R1025 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the National 
Police Service in the following programmes 

6,111,341,296 90,487,600 

 
0601000 Policing Services 6,111,341,296 90,487,600 

R1026 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Internal Security & National 
Administration in the following programmes 

6,736,302,124 32,100,000 

 
0629000 General Administration and Support 
Services 

6,276,160,000 7,000,000 

 
0630000 Policy Coordination Services 70,000,000 25,100,000 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid  

0632000 National Government Field Administration   
Services 

390,142,124 - 

R1032 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Devolution in the following 
programmes 

28,000,000 - 

 
0712000 Devolution Services 28,000,000 - 

R1036 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for the ASALs and Regional 
Development in the following programmes 

5,289,770,000 7,245,000 

 
0733000 Accelerated ASAL Development 4,534,700,000 -  
0743000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

4,470,000 3,245,000 

 
1013000 Integrated Regional Development 750,600,000 4,000,000 

R1041 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Ministry of 
Defence in the following programmes 

6,230,000,000 (1,476,673,894) 

 
0801000 Defence 6,000,000,000 (1,476,673,894)  
0803000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

230,000,000 - 

R1053 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Foreign Affairs in the following 
programmes 

922,966,133 132,978,526 

 
0714000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

816,825,359 50,000,000 

 
0715000 Foreign Relation and Diplomacy 106,140,774 82,978,526 

R1064 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Technical Vocational Education 
and Training in the following programmes 

1,664,576,119 6,440,722,988 

 
0505000 Technical Vocational Education and 
Training 

1,216,261,963 6,440,722,988 

 
0508000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

448,314,156 - 

R1065 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Higher Education and Research 
in the following programmes 

6,610,400,823 9,639,140,344 

 
0504000 University Education 6,479,400,823 9,619,140,344  
0506000 Research, Science, Technology and 
Innovation 

(558,250) 20,000,000 

 
0508000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

131,558,250 - 

R1066 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Basic Education in the following 
programmes 

1,230,000,000 - 

 
0501000 Primary Education (3,698,305) -  
0502000 Secondary Education (5,146,116,272) -  
0503000 Quality Assurance and Standards 6,129,814,577 -  
0508000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

250,000,000 - 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

R1071 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of The National 
Treasury in the following programmes 

11,224,555,756 409,054,511 

 
0717000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

12,527,740,146 - 

 
0718000 Public Financial Management (1,562,670,000) 409,054,511  
0719000 Economic and Financial Policy Formulation 
and Management 

150,000,000 - 

 
0720000 Market Competition 109,485,610 - 

R1072 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Economic Planning in the 
following programmes 

383,921,168 2,287,480 

 
0710000 Public Service Transformation (2,000,000) -  
07710000 Monitoring and Evaluation Services (1,200,000) -  
0706000 Economic Policy and National Planning 364,200,000 -  
0709000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

22,921,168 2,287,480 

R1082 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Medical Services in the following 
programmes 

9,107,568,100 3,169,000,000 

 
0402000 National Referral & Specialized Services 3,202,068,100 3,169,000,000  
0410000 Curative & Reproductive Maternal New 
Born Child Adolescent Health RMNCAH 

150,000,000 - 

 
0412000 General Administration 5,755,500,000 - 

R1083 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Public Health and Professional 
Standards in the following programmes 

4,741,000,000 223,870,855 

 
0406000 Preventive and Promotive Health Services 885,430,000 34,960,000  
0407000 Health Resources Development and 
Innovation 

1,944,070,000 5,835,855 

 
0408000 Health Policy, Standards and Regulations 70,000,000 183,075,000  
0412000 General Administration 1,841,500,000 - 

R1092 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Transport in the following 
programmes 

408,700,000 2,356,163,577 

 
0201000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

378,700,000 3,483,577 

 
0205000 Air Transport 50,000,000 -  
0216000 Road Safety (20,000,000) 2,352,680,000 

R1093 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Shipping and Maritime Affairs in 
the following programmes 

276,400,000 (10,000,000) 

 
0220000 Shipping and Maritime Affairs 276,400,000 (10,000,000) 

R1094 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Housing & Urban Development 
in the following programmes 

149,115,526 1,926,600,000 

 
0102000 Housing Development and Human 
Settlement 

25,948,673 1,926,600,000 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid  

0105000 Urban and Metropolitan Development 8,527,808 -  
0106000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

114,639,045 - 

R1095 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Public Works in the following 
programmes 

368,000,000 2,100,000 

 
0103000 Government Buildings 16,800,000 -  
0104000 Coastline Infrastructure and Pedestrian 
Access 

4,000,000 - 

 
0106000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

101,216,950 2,100,000 

 
0218000 Regulation and Development of the 
Construction Industry 

245,983,050 - 

R1104 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Irrigation in the following 
programmes 

207,320,919 - 

 
1014000 Irrigation and Land Reclamation 194,102,079 -  
1022000 Water Harvesting and Storage for Irrigation 4,100,000 -  
1023000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

9,118,840 - 

R1109 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Water & Sanitation in the 
following programmes 

451,212,014 445,000,000 

 
1001000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

105,012,014 - 

 
1004000 Water Resources Management 156,200,000 -  
1017000 Water and Sewerage Infrastructure 
Development 

190,000,000 445,000,000 

R1122 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Information Communication 
Technology & Digital Economy in the following 
programmes 

511,900,000 (1,200,000,000) 

 
0207000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

29,750,000 - 

 
0210000 ICT Infrastructure Development 67,850,000 -  
0217000 E-Government Services 414,300,000 (1,200,000,000) 

R1123 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Broadcasting & 
Telecommunications in the following 
programmes 

861,599,029 50,000,000 

 
0207000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

11,906,917 - 

 
0208000 Information And Communication Services 827,692,112 -  
0209000 Mass Media Skills Development 22,000,000 50,000,000 

R1132 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Sports in the following 
programmes 

250,100,000 1,500,000 

 
0901000 Sports 250,100,000 1,500,000 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

R1134 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Culture and Heritage in the 
following programmes 

258,120,000 219,933,260 

 
0902000 Culture/ Heritage 185,062,240 208,233,260  
0903000 The Arts 22,000,000 11,700,000  
0904000 Library Services 52,437,760 -  
0905000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

(1,380,000) - 

R1135 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Youth Affairs and Creative 
Economy in the following programmes 

517,700,000 8,558,224 

 
0221000 Film Development Services 173,000,000 8,558,224  
0711000 Youth Empowerment Services 250,000,000 -  
0748000 Youth Development Services 81,105,914 -  
0749000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

13,594,086 - 

R1152 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Energy in the following 
programmes 

72,800,000 - 

 
0211000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

(11,000,000) - 

 
0212000 Power Generation 87,800,000 -  
0214000 Alternative Energy Technologies (4,000,000) - 

R1166 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for the Blue Economy and Fisheries 
in the following programmes 

489,570,000 48,000,000 

 
0111000 Fisheries Development and Management 443,570,000 48,000,000  
0117000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

46,000,000 - 

R1169 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Agriculture in the following 
programmes 

102,000,000 1,877,000,000 

 
0107000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

45,000,000 1,877,000,000 

 
0108000 Crop Development and Management 57,000,000 - 

R1174 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Trade in the following 
programmes 

2,213,580,000 20,000,000 

 
0309000 Domestic Trade and Enterprise 
Development 

1,510,000,000 - 

 
0310000 Fair Trade Practices and Compliance of 
Standards 

59,280,000 20,000,000 

 
0311000 International Trade Development and 
Promotion 

586,000,000 - 

 
0312000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

58,300,000 - 

R1175 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 

611,693,100 313,000,000 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

Department for Industry in the following 
programmes  
0301000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

119,400,000 5,000,000 

 
0320000 Industrial Promotion and Development 195,000,000 288,000,000  
0321000 Standards and Quality Infrastructure & 
Research 

297,293,100 20,000,000 

R1176 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Micro, Small and Medium 
Enterprises Development in the following 
programmes 

210,000,000 344,500,000 

 
0316000 Promotion and Development of MSMEs 111,700,000 -  
0317000 Product and Market Development for 
MSMEs 

- 136,300,000 

 
0318000 Digitization and Financial Inclusion for 
MSMEs 

- 208,200,000 

 
0319000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

98,300,000 - 

R1177 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Investment Promotion in the 
following programmes 

382,370,000 229,000,000 

 
0322000 Investment Development and Promotion 382,370,000 229,000,000 

R1184 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Labour and Skills Development 
in the following programmes 

291,001,127 - 

 
0910000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

33,854,693 - 

 
0906000 Labour, Employment and Safety Services 247,582,994 -  
0907000 Manpower Development, Industrial Skills & 
Productivity Management 

9,563,440 - 

R1185 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Social Protection and Senior 
Citizens Affairs in the following programmes 

192,500,000 70,000,000 

 
0908000 Social Development and Children Services 141,791,000 70,000,000  
0909000 National Social Safety Net 40,209,000 -  
0914000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

10,500,000 - 

R1192 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Mining in the following 
programmes 

134,200,000 300,000,000 

 
1007000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

100,000,000 - 

 
1009000 Mineral Resources Management 13,000,000 272,000,000  
1021000 Geological Survey and Geoinformation 
Management 

21,200,000 28,000,000 

R1193 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Petroleum in the following 
programmes 

11,349,090 8,000,000 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid  

0215000 Exploration and Distribution of Oil and Gas 11,349,090 8,000,000 

R1202 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Tourism in the following 
programmes 

21,679,807 3,734,108,192 

 
0313000 Tourism Promotion and Marketing - 216,250,000  
0314000 Tourism Product Development and 
Diversification 

- 3,517,858,192 

 
0315000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

21,679,807 - 

R1213 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Public Service in the following 
programmes 

546,426,510 13,000,000 

 
0710000 Public Service Transformation 246,383,295 13,000,000  
0709000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

79,143,215 - 

 
0747000 National Youth Service 220,900,000 - 

R1221 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for East African Community in the 
following programmes 

278,970,000 - 

 
0305000 East African Affairs and Regional 
Integration 

278,970,000 - 

R1252 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State Law 
Office in the following programmes 

240,952,960 - 

 
0606000 Legal Services (27,983,991) -  
0607000 Governance, Legal Training and 
Constitutional Affairs 

220,995,900 - 

 
0609000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

47,941,051 - 

R1261 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Judiciary in 
the following programmes 

875,710,165 - 

 
0610000 Dispensation of Justice 875,710,165 - 

R1271 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Ethics and 
Anti-Corruption Commission in the following 
programmes 

35,800,000 - 

 
0611000 Ethics and Anti-Corruption 35,800,000 - 

R1281 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the National 
Intelligence Service in the following programmes 

9,300,000,000 - 

 
0804000 National Security Intelligence 9,300,000,000 - 

R1291 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Office of 
the Director of Public Prosecutions in the 
following programmes 

212,400,000 3,000,000 

 
0612000 Public Prosecution Services 212,400,000 3,000,000 

R1321 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Witness 
Protection Agency in the following programmes 

26,000,000 - 

 
0615000 Witness Protection 26,000,000 - 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

R1331 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Environment & Climate Change 
in the following programmes 

182,000,000 - 

 
1002000 Environment Management and Protection 213,000,000 -  
1010000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

(31,000,000) - 

R1332 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the State 
Department for Forestry in the following 
programmes 

169,200,000 - 

 
1018000 Forests Development, Management and 
Conservation 

143,300,000 - 

 
1025000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

25,900,000 - 

R2011 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Kenya 
National Commission on Human Rights in the 
following programmes 

5,000,000 - 

 
0616000 Protection and Promotion of Human Rights 5,000,000 - 

R2021 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the National 
Land Commission in the following programmes 

176,000,000 - 

 
0119000 Land Administration and Management 176,000,000 - 

R2041 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the 
Parliamentary Service Commission in the 
following programmes 

89,000,000 - 

 
0765000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

89,000,000 - 

R2042 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the National 
Assembly in the following programmes 

847,230,000 - 

 
0721000 National Legislation, Representation and 
Oversight 

847,230,000 - 

R2043 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the 
Parliamentary Joint Services in the following 
programmes 

216,000,000 - 

 
0723000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

216,000,000 - 

R2044 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Senate in 
the following programmes 

362,630,000 - 

 
0767000 Senate Legislation and Oversight 140,500,000 -  
0768000 Senate Representation, Liaison & 
Intergovernmental Relations 

105,430,000 - 

 
0769000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

116,700,000 - 

R2051 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Judicial 
Service Commission in the following 
programmes 

98,980,000 - 

 
0619000 Judicial Oversight 98,980,000 - 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

R2071 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Public 
Service Commission in the following 
programmes 

92,342,795 - 

 
0725000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

139,342,795 - 

 
0726000 Human Resource management and 
Development 

(72,300,000) - 

 
0727000 Governance and National Values 17,200,000 -  
0744000 Performance and Productivity Management 8,300,000 -  
075000 Administration of Quasi- Judicial Functions (200,000) - 

R2081 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Salaries 
and Remuneration Commission in the following 
programmes 

101,024,396 150,000 

 
0728000 Salaries and Remuneration Management 101,024,396 150,000 

R2091 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Teachers 
Service Commission in the following 
programmes 

17,473,697,360 454,000,000 

 
0509000 Teacher Resource Management 17,438,697,360 100,000,000  
0510000 Governance and Standards (200,000,000) 300,000,000  
0511000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

235,000,000 54,000,000 

R2111 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the Auditor 
General in the following programmes 

149,764,800 - 

 
0729000 Audit Services 149,764,800 - 

R2131 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the 
Commission on Administrative Justice in the 
following programmes 

3,300,000 - 

 
0731000 Promotion of Administrative Justice 3,300,000 - 

R2141 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the National 
Gender and Equality Commission in the 
following programmes 

30,000,000 - 

 
0621000 Promotion of Gender Equality and Freedom 
from Discrimination 

30,000,000 - 

R2151 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for current expenses of the 
Independent Policing Oversight Authority in the 
following programmes 

20,000,000 - 

 
0622000 Policing Oversight Services 20,000,000 -  
Sub-Cluster Total 107,872,867,784 32,606,280,443 

 

 

(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid  

Development Expenditure 
  

D1011 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the Executive 

50,000,000 - 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

Office of the President in the following 
programmes  
0703000 Government Advisory Services 50,000,000 - 

D1013 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the Office of 
the Prime Cabinet Secretary in the following 
programmes 

65,000,000 - 

 
0755000 Government Coordination and Supervision 65,000,000 - 

D1017 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State House 
in the following programmes 

400,000,000 - 

 
0704000 State House Affairs 400,000,000 - 

D1023 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Correctional Services in the 
following programmes 

70,000,000 - 

 
0627000 Prison Services 70,000,000 - 

D1025 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the National 
Police Service in the following programmes 

50,000,000 500,000,000 

 
0601000 Policing Services 50,000,000 500,000,000 

D1026 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Internal Security & National 
Administration in the following programmes 

2,510,000,000 - 

 
0629000 General Administration and Support 
Services 

2,525,000,000 - 

 
0632000 National Government Field Administration   
Services 

(15,000,000) - 

D1036 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for the ASALs and Regional 
Development in the following programmes 

1,039,264,212 - 

 
0733000 Accelerated ASAL Development 2,294,728 -  
1013000 Integrated Regional Development 1,036,969,484 - 

D1041 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the Ministry of 
Defence in the following programmes 

- 2,000,000,000 

 
0801000 Defence - 2,000,000,000 

D1064 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Technical Vocational Education 
and Training in the following programmes 

60,000,000 (950,000,000) 

 
0505000 Technical Vocational Education and 
Training 

60,000,000 (950,000,000) 

D1066 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Basic Education in the following 
programmes 

6,600,000,000 (179,000,000) 

 
0501000 Primary Education 5,890,000,000 (179,000,000)  
0502000 Secondary Education 710,000,000 - 

D1072 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 

2,226,404,000 (20,000,000) 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

Department for Economic Planning in the 
following programmes  
0707000 National Statistical Information Services 2,226,404,000 (20,000,000) 

D1082 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Medical Services in the following 
programmes 

2,508,192,428 (3,199,333,334) 

 
0402000 National Referral & Specialized Services (1,180,568,100) (3,194,666,667)  
0410000 Curative & Reproductive Maternal New 
Born Child Adolescent Health RMNCAH 

3,858,760,528 (4,666,667) 

 
0411000 Health Research and Innovations (170,000,000) - 

D1083 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Public Health  and Professional 
Standards in the following programmes 

570,308,317 100,000,000 

 
0406000 Preventive and Promotive Health Services 383,058,317 100,000,000  
0407000 Health Resources Development and 
Innovation 

137,250,000 - 

 
0408000 Health Policy, Standards and Regulations 50,000,000 - 

D1091 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Roads in the following 
programmes 

10,008,068,132 6,986,894,952 

 
0202000 Road Transport 10,008,068,132 6,986,894,952 

D1092 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Transport in the following 
programmes 

2,024,750,000 (3,472,662,500) 

 
0201000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

34,750,000 327,337,500 

 
0203000 Rail Transport 2,240,000,000 (1,800,000,000)  
0204000 Marine Transport (65,000,000) (2,000,000,000)  
0216000 Road Safety (185,000,000) - 

D1093 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Shipping  and Maritime Affairs in 
the following programmes 

370,000,000 - 

 
0220000 Shipping and Maritime Affairs 370,000,000 - 

D1095 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Public Works in the following 
programmes 

100,000,000 - 

 
0104000 Coastline Infrastructure and Pedestrian 
Access 

100,000,000 - 

D1152 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Energy in the following 
programmes 

819,531,352 (7,639,058,843) 

 
0211000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

- 30,000,000 

 
0212000 Power Generation 1,524,531,352 (4,403,250,000)  
0213000 Power Transmission and Distribution 145,000,000 (3,165,808,843)  
0214000 Alternative Energy Technologies (850,000,000) (100,000,000) 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

D1166 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for the Blue Economy and Fisheries 
in the following programmes 

1,122,000,000 756,745,480 

 
0111000 Fisheries Development and Management 1,400,000,000 756,745,480  
0117000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

- - 

 
0118000 Development and Coordination of the Blue 
Economy 

(278,000,000) - 

D1169 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Agriculture in the following 
programmes 

1,133,559,042 491,265,034 

 
0107000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

(2,010,000,000) (18,000,000) 

 
0108000 Crop Development and Management 3,083,559,042 159,265,034  
0109000 Agribusiness and Information Management 60,000,000 350,000,000  
0120000 Agricultural Research & Development - - 

D1173 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Cooperatives in the following 
programmes 

1,014,000,000 - 

 
0304000 Cooperative Development and Management 1,014,000,000 - 

D1184 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Labour and Skills Development 
in the following programmes 

538,210,000 - 

 
0906000 Labour, Employment and Safety Services 51,440,000 -  
0907000 Manpower Development, Industrial Skills & 
Productivity Management 

486,770,000 - 

D1202 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Tourism in the following 
programmes 

- 400,000,000 

 
0314000 Tourism Product Development and 
Diversification 

- 400,000,000 

D1203 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Wildlife in the following 
programmes 

650,000,000 - 

 
1019000 Wildlife Conservation and Management 650,000,000 - 

D1213 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Public Service in the following 
programmes 

300,000,000 - 

 
0710000 Public Service Transformation 300,000,000 - 

D1271 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the Ethics and 
Anti-Corruption Commission in the following 
programmes 

24,700,000 - 

 
0611000 Ethics and Anti-Corruption 24,700,000 - 

D1291 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the Office of 

20,000,000 - 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

the Director of Public Prosecutions in the 
following programmes  
0612000 Public Prosecution Services 20,000,000 - 

D1331 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Environment & Climate  Change 
in the following programmes 

437,000,000 - 

 
1002000 Environment Management and Protection 437,000,000 - 

D2043 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the 
Parliamentary Joint Services in the following 
programmes 

200,000,000 - 

 
0723000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

200,000,000 - 

D2091 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the Teachers 
Service Commission in the following 
programmes 

400,383,436 39,000,000 

 
0509000 Teacher Resource Management 400,383,436 -  
0510000 Governance and Standards - -  
0511000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

- 39,000,000 

D2111 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the Auditor 
General in the following programmes 

235,200 - 

 
0729000 Audit Services 235,200 -  
Sub-Cluster Total 35,311,606,119 (4,186,149,211)  
Cluster Total 143,184,473,903 28,420,131,232 

 

SECOND SCHEDULE 

THAT, the Second Schedule to the Bill be amended and replaced with the following new Schedule— 

SECOND SCHEDULE 

(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote No. Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid  

Recurrent Expenditure 
  

R1014 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the State Department 
for Parliamentary Affairs in the following 
programmes 

(24,974,704) - 

 
0759000 Parliamentary Liaison and Legislative Affairs (9,912,000) -  
0760000 Policy Coordination and Strategy (800,000) -  
0761000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

(14,262,704) - 

R1016 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the State Department 
for Cabinet Affairs in the following programmes 

(10,000,000) - 

 
0758000 Cabinet Affairs Services (10,000,000) - 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote No. Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid 

R1054 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the State Department 
for Diaspora Affairs in the following programmes 

(4,130,037) - 

 
0752000 Management of Diaspora Affairs (4,130,037) - 

R1091 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the State Department 
for Roads in the following programmes 

(76,029,859) - 

 
0202000 Road Transport (76,029,859) - 

R1112 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the State Department 
for Lands and Physical Planning in the following 
programmes 

(16,000,000) 420,000,000 

 
0101000 Land Policy and Planning (16,000,000) 226,183,139  
0121000 Land Information Management - -  
0122000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

- 193,816,861 

R1162 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the State Department 
for Livestock Development in the following 
programmes 

(39,300,000) 216,349,750 

 
0112000 Livestock Resources Management and 
Development 

(39,300,000) 216,349,750 

R1173 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the State Department 
for Cooperatives in the following programmes 

(1,379,300,000) - 

 
0304000 Cooperative Development and Management (1,379,300,000) - 

R1203 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the State Department 
for Wildlife in the following programmes 

(3,700,000) - 

 
1019000 Wildlife Conservation and Management (3,700,000) - 

R1212 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the State Department 
for Gender and Affirmative Action in the following 
programmes 

(16,200,000) - 

 
0911000 Community Development (8,000,000) -  
0912000 Gender Empowerment (13,000,000) -  
0913000 General Administration, Planning and 
Support Services 

4,800,000 - 

R1311 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the Office of the 
Registrar of Political Parties in the following 
programmes 

(204,000,000) - 

 
0614000 Registration, Regulation and Funding of 
Political Parties 

(204,000,000) - 

R2031 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the Independent 
Electoral and Boundaries Commission in the 
following programmes 

30,000,000 - 

 
0617000 Management of Electoral Processes 30,000,000 - 

R2061 The amount required in the year ending 30th June, 
2025 for current expenses of the Commission on 
Revenue Allocation in the following programmes 

(7,276,461) 1,000,000 

 
0737000 Inter-Governmental Transfers and Financial 
Matters 

(7,276,461) 1,000,000 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote No. Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation 
in Aid  

Sub-Cluster Total (1,750,911,061) 637,349,750 
 

(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation in 
Aid  

Development Expenditure 
  

D1024 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Immigration and Citizen 
Services in the following programmes 

- 2,703,158,000 

 
0605000 Migration & Citizen Services - 2,703,158,000 

D1032 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Devolution in the following 
programmes 

(1,087,250,000) - 

 
0712000 Devolution Services (1,087,250,000) - 

D1065 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Higher  Education and 
Research in the following programmes 

(532,203,600) - 

 
0504000 University Education (532,203,600) - 

D1071 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the The 
National  Treasury in the following programmes 

(1,643,540,506) (11,822,100,302) 

 
0717000 General Administration Planning and 
Support Services 

7,794,822,478 (701,499,380) 

 
0718000 Public Financial Management (5,528,742,541) (11,120,600,922)  
0719000 Economic and Financial Policy Formulation 
and Management 

(3,909,620,443) - 

D1192 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Mining in the following 
programmes 

- 160,000,000 

 
1009000 Mineral Resources Management - 56,000,000  
1021000 Geological Survey and Geoinformation  
Management 

- 104,000,000 

D1094 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Housing & Urban Development 
in the following programmes 

(14,287,500,000) 368,537,398 

 
0102000 Housing Development and Human 
Settlement 

(8,625,062,870) 468,537,398 

 
0105000 Urban and Metropolitan Development (5,662,437,130) (100,000,000) 

D1104 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Irrigation in the following 
programmes 

(1,260,000,000) 715,000,000 

 
1014000 Irrigation and Land Reclamation (706,000,000) 715,000,000  
1015000 Water Storage and Flood Control (304,000,000) -  
1022000 Water Harvesting and Storage for Irrigation (250,000,000) - 

D1109 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Water & Sanitation in the 
following programmes 

(6,686,628,874) (14,140,600,000) 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation in 
Aid  

1004000 Water Resources Management (1,249,000,000) (4,626,000,000)  
1017000 Water and Sewerage Infrastructure 
Development 

(5,437,628,874) (9,514,600,000) 

D1112 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Lands and Physical Planning in 
the following programmes 

(30,000,000) 1,800,000,000 

 
0101000 Land Policy and Planning (30,000,000) 1,169,500,000  
0121000 Land Information Management - 630,500,000 

D1122 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Information Communication 
Technology & Digital Economy in the following 
programmes 

(2,520,000,000) (4,732,000,000) 

 
0210000 ICT Infrastructure Development (2,350,000,000) (4,402,000,000)  
0217000 E-Government  Services (170,000,000) (330,000,000) 

D1135 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Youth Affairs and Creative 
Economy in the following programmes 

(601,710,000) 400,000,000 

 
0711000 Youth Empowerment Services 100,000,000 400,000,000  
0748000 Youth Development Services (701,710,000) - 

D1162 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Livestock Development in the 
following programmes 

(1,015,000,000) (1,000,000,000) 

 
0112000 Livestock Resources Management and 
Development 

(1,015,000,000) (1,000,000,000) 

D1175 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Industry in the following 
programmes 

820,700,000 - 

 
0320000 Industrial Promotion and Development 1,000,000,000 -  
0321000 Standards and Qualitry Infrastucture & 
Research 

(179,300,000) - 

D1176 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Micro, Small and Medium 
Enterprises Development in the following 
programmes 

(102,000,000) (50,000,000) 

 
0316000 Promotion and Development of MSMEs (102,000,000) (50,000,000) 

D1177 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Investment Promotion in the 
following programmes 

(255,420,000) - 

 
0322000 Investment Development and Promotion (255,420,000) - 

D1185 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Social Protection and Senior 
Citizens Affairs in the following programmes 

(100,000,000) - 

 
0909000 National Social Safety Net (100,000,000) - 

D1212 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 

(558,950,596) - 



(1) (2) (3) (4) 

Vote 
No. 

Service or Purpose Supply Appropriation in 
Aid 

Department for Gender and Affirmative Action 
in the following programmes  
0911000 Community Development (520,000,000) -  
0912000 Gender Empowerment (38,950,596) - 

D1261 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the The 
Judiciary in the following programmes 

(55,000,000) - 

 
0610000 Dispensation of Justice (55,000,000) - 

D1332 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the State 
Department for Forestry in the following 
programmes 

(200,000,000) (272,000,000) 

 
1018000 Forests Development, Management and 
Conservation 

(200,000,000) (272,000,000) 

D2141 The amount required in the year ending 30th 
June, 2025 for capital expenses of the National 
Gender and Equality Commission in the 
following programmes 

(10,000,000) - 

 
0621000 Promotion of Gender Equality and 
Freedom from Discrimination 

(10,000,000) - 

 
Sub-Cluster Total (30,124,503,576) (25,870,004,904)  
Cluster Total (31,875,414,637) (25,232,655,154)  
Grand Total 111,309,059,266 3,187,476,078 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (433) 

II. THE COUNTY GOVERNMENTS ADDITIONAL 

ALLOCATIONS BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY 

BILL NO. 2 OF 2025) 

Notice is given that the Chairperson of the Chairperson of the Liaison Committee 
intends to move the following amendments to the County Governments 
Additional Allocations Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 2 of 2025) at the 
Committee Stage— 

 

CLAUSE 5 

THAT, Clause 5 of the Bill be amended in sub clause (4) by deleting the words 

“subsection 3(d) and (e)” and substituting therefor the words “subsection 3(e) and (f). 

FIRST SCHEDULE 

THAT, the First Schedule to the Bill be deleted and replaced with the following new 

Schedule— 

FIRST SCHEDULE 

Conditional Additional Allocations to County Governments from National Government’s Share of 
Revenue in FY  2024/25 (Kenya Shillings) 

    FY 2023/24 FY 2024/25 

SN COUNTY  Total 
Conditional 
Additional 
Allocations  

County 
Aggregation 
and 
Industrial 
Parks 
(CAIP) 
Programme 

Community 
Health 
Promoters 
(CHPs) 
Project 

 Basic Salary 
Arrears for 
County 
Government 
Health 
Workers. 

Total 
Conditional 
Additional 
Allocations  

    Column A Column B Column C Column D Column E 

1 Baringo 92,926,764   63,810,000 19,263,318     83,073,318  

2 Bomet 132,634,641   74,070,000 21,261,693   95,331,693  

3 Bungoma 492,962,800 186,000,000 107,400,000 39,854,059          
333,254,059  

4 Busia 376,591,665 186,000,000 66,390,000 23,691,627       
276,081,627  

5 Elgeyo/Marakwet 64,400,155   37,200,000 15,685,017      
52,885,017  

6 Embu 363,131,838 186,000,000 60,300,000 32,801,231       
279,101,231  

7 Garissa 264,807,925 186,000,000 74,520,000 32,981,339   293,501,339  

8 Homa Bay 415,917,803 186,000,000 88,620,000 26,419,251 301,039,251  

9 Isiolo 64,333,234   21,630,000 12,147,883   33,777,883  

10 Kajiado 41,355,485   50,070,000 43,495,118    93,565,118  

11 Kakamega 294,386,469   127,500,000 44,529,977 172,029,977  

12 Kericho 140,552,947   45,690,000 43,439,856      
89,129,856  

13 Kiambu 409,665,074 52,631,579 94,680,000 119,957,202  267,268,781  

14 Kilifi 138,924,099   116,100,000 58,281,743   174,381,743  

15 Kirinyaga 367,510,449 186,000,000 36,660,000 19,389,816 242,049,816  



Conditional Additional Allocations to County Governments from National Government’s Share of 
Revenue in FY  2024/25 (Kenya Shillings) 

    FY 2023/24 FY 2024/25 

SN COUNTY  Total 
Conditional 
Additional 
Allocations  

County 
Aggregation 
and 
Industrial 
Parks 
(CAIP) 
Programme 

Community 
Health 
Promoters 
(CHPs) 
Project 

 Basic Salary 
Arrears for 
County 
Government 
Health 
Workers. 

Total 
Conditional 
Additional 
Allocations  

    Column A Column B Column C Column D Column E 

16 Kisii 186,645,942 173,368,421 88,200,000 72,428,277 333,996,698  

17 Kisumu 130,537,637   89,940,000 75,399,627 165,339,627  

18 Kitui 179,499,580   74,100,000 43,756,694 117,856,694  

19 Kwale 90,011,220 226,000,000 52,140,000 28,773,123    306,913,123  

20 Laikipia 76,547,852   25,230,000 40,454,974 65,684,974  

21 Lamu 62,515,370   14,520,000 11,301,830   25,821,830  

22 Machakos 445,350,986 186,000,000 83,250,000 58,646,293 327,896,293  

23 Makueni 173,836,213   113,700,000 30,568,273  144,268,273  

24 Mandera 13,777,962   18,540,000 19,809,159     38,349,159  

25 Marsabit 2,389,320   60,090,000 15,028,763 75,118,763  

26 Meru 488,329,627 186,000,000 111,480,000 43,915,785    341,395,785  

27 Migori 394,621,807 186,000,000 88,380,000 27,687,815 302,067,815  

28 Mombasa 262,131,098 52,631,579 71,610,000 108,971,914     
233,213,493  

29 Murang'a 452,896,800 52,631,579 46,050,000 56,993,611 155,675,190  

30 Nairobi 14,721,991   224,010,000 112,268,649  336,278,649  

31 Nakuru 484,883,209 52,631,579 99,390,000 90,404,261 242,425,840  

32 Nandi 378,705,606 52,631,579 96,660,000 26,764,781 176,056,360  

33 Narok 139,655,079   49,800,000 21,496,514  71,296,514  

34 Nyamira 342,563,428 52,631,579 44,370,000 19,979,711 116,981,290  

35 Nyandarua 242,624,039   41,610,000 16,043,981     57,653,981  

36 Nyeri 156,487,648   74,250,000 55,172,326   129,422,326  

37 Samburu 12,431,664   46,140,000 13,079,798     59,219,798  

38 Siaya 423,929,548 52,631,579 63,810,000 22,723,820 139,165,399  

39 Taita Taveta 50,418,729   41,070,000 32,591,911      73,661,911  

40 Tana River 136,049,566   28,890,000 6,982,057  35,872,057  

41 Tharaka Nithi 174,459,830   37,950,000 24,597,481      
62,547,481  

42 Trans Nzoia 366,941,692 52,631,579 67,200,000 46,626,677   166,458,256  

43 Turkana 12,815,035   74,250,000 24,986,518 99,236,518  

44 Uasin Gishu 379,487,557 186,000,000 61,980,000 9,600,471 257,580,471  

45 Vihiga 97,662,444   43,380,000 15,044,112 58,424,112  

46 Wajir 11,656,907 173,368,421 60,810,000 19,869,801 254,048,222  

47 West Pokot 72,161,965   77,490,000 13,933,594       
91,423,594  

  GRAND 
TOTAL 

10,116,848,690 2,853,789,474 3,234,930,000 1,759,101,729 7,847,821,203  

 

 

 

 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (435) 

THIRD SCHEDULE 

THAT, the Third Schedule to the Bill be deleted and replaced with the following new 

Schedule— 
  Conditional Additional Allocations from proceeds of loans or grants from Development Partners for Financial Year 2024/25 (Kenya Shillings) 

      FY 2024/25 

S
N 

County  

T
o

ta
l 
L

o
a
n

s 
a
n

d
 G

ra
n

ts
 f

o
r 

F
Y

 

2
0
23

/
24

 

D
A

N
ID

A
 G

ra
n

t 
to

 f
in

a
n

c
e 

P
ri

m
a
ry

 H
e
al

th
 C

a
re

 i
n

 
D

e
vo

lv
e
d

 C
o

n
te

x
t 

ID
A

(W
o

rl
d

 B
a
n

k
) 

- 
K

e
n

y
a 

In
fo

rm
a
l 

S
e
tt

le
m

e
n

t 
Im

p
ro

ve
m

e
n

t 
P

ro
je

c
t-

II
 (

K
IS

IP
 

II
) 

A
F

D
- 

K
e
n

y
a
 I

n
fo

rm
a
l 

S
e
tt

le
m

e
n

t 
Im

p
ro

ve
m

e
n

t 

P
ro

je
c
t-

II
 (

K
IS

IP
 I

I)
 

ID
A

(W
o

rl
d

 B
a
n

k
)-

E
m

e
rg

e
n

cy
 

L
o

c
u

st
 R

e
sp

o
n

se
 

P
ro

je
c
t(

E
L

R
P

) 

K
fW

(G
e
rm

a
n

y 
D

e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
B

a
n

k
) 

lo
a
n

 f
o

r 
 C

o
-F

in
a
n

ci
n

g
 o

f 

F
L

L
o

C
A

 -
C

o
u

n
ty

 C
li

m
a
te

 
R

e
si

li
e
n

c
e 

In
ve

st
m

e
n

t(
C

C
R

I)
G

ra
n

t 
 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
 )

-l
o

a
n

 f
o

r 
th

e
 

F
in

a
n

c
in

g
 o

f 
F

L
L

o
C

A
 -

C
o

u
n

ty
 

C
li

m
a
te

 R
e
si

li
e
n

c
e 

In
ve

st
m

e
n

t(
C

C
R

I)
G

ra
n

t 
 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
) 

L
o

a
n

 f
o

r 
th

e 

F
o

o
d

 S
y
te

m
s 

R
e
si

li
e
n

c
e 

P
ro

je
c
t 

(F
S
R

P
) 

ID
A

 W
o

rl
d

 B
a
n

k
 L

o
a
n

 f
o

r 
th

e
 

N
a
ti

o
n

a
l 

A
g

ri
c
u

lt
u

ra
l 

V
a
lu

e 
C

h
a
in

 D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 

P
ro

je
c
t(

N
A

V
C

D
P

) 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
) 

lo
a
n

 f
o

r 
th

e
 

W
a
te

r 
&

 S
a
n

it
a
ti

o
n

 
D

e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
P

ro
je

c
t 

(W
S
D

P
) 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
)-

K
e
n

y
a
 

D
e
vo

lu
ti

o
n

 S
u

p
p

o
rt

 P
ro

g
ra

m
-I

I 
(K

D
S
P

 I
I)

 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
)C

re
d

it
: 
K

e
n

y
a 

U
rb

a
n

 S
u

p
p

o
rt

 P
ro

je
c
t(

K
U

S
P

)-
U

rb
a
n

 I
n

st
it

u
ti

o
n

a
l 
G

ra
n

t(
U

IG
) 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
 C

re
d

it
: 
K

e
n

y
a
 

U
rb

a
n

 S
u

p
p

o
rt

 P
ro

je
c
t(

K
U

S
P

)-
 

U
rb

a
n

 D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
G

ra
n

t 
(U

D
G

) 

In
te

rn
a
ti

o
n

a
l 
F

u
n

d
 f

o
r 

A
g

ri
c
u

lt
u

ra
l 

D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t(
IF

A
D

)-
lo

a
n

 f
o

r 
K

e
n

y
a
 L

iv
e
st

o
c
k

 
C

o
m

m
e
rc

ia
li

z
a
ti

o
n

 P
ro

je
c
t 

(K
e
L

C
o

P
) 

K
fW

 (
G

e
rm

a
n

 D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 

B
a
n

k
) 

lo
a
n

 f
o

r 
D

ro
u

g
h

t 
R

e
si

li
e
n

c
e 

P
ro

g
ra

m
m

e
 i

n
 

N
o

rt
h

e
rn

 K
e
n

y
a 

(D
R

P
N

K
) 

In
te

rn
a
ti

o
n

a
l 
F

u
n

d
 f

o
r 

A
g

ri
c
u

lt
u

ra
l 

D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t(
IF

A
D

) 
fo

r 
th

e 
A

q
u

a
c
u

lt
u

re
 B

u
si

n
e
ss

 
D

e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
P

ro
je

c
t 

(A
B

D
P

) 

U
n

it
e
d

 N
a
ti

o
n

s 
F

u
n

d
 F

o
r 

P
o

p
u

la
ti

o
n

 A
c
ti

vi
ti

e
s(

U
N

F
P

A
) 

G
ra

n
t 

- 
10

th
 C

o
u

n
tr

y 
G

ra
n

t 

S
W

E
D

E
N

 -
 K

e
n

y
a
 A

g
ri

c
u

lt
u

ra
l 

B
u

si
n

e
ss

 D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
P

ro
je

c
t 

(K
A

B
D

P
) 

T
o

ta
l 
L

o
a
n

s 
a
n

d
 G

ra
n

ts
 f

o
r 

F
Y

 
2
0
24

/
25

 

    
Colum
n A 

Colu
mn B 

Col
umn 
C 

C
o
l
u
m
n 
D 

Colum
n E 

C
ol
u
m
n 
F 

Col
umn 
G 

Colu
mn 
H 

Colu
mn I 

Colu
mn J 

Colu
mn 
K 

Col
um
n L 

Colu
mn 
M 

Colu
mn 
N 

Col
um
n P 

Colum
n Q 

Column 
R 

Colu
mn S 

Column 
T 

1 Baringo 315,951,823 7,848,750     121,025,000                 40,150,000     9,620,000   178,643,750 

2 Bomet 416,348,367 8,482,500                                 8,482,500 

3 Bungoma 725,703,372 13,698,750                       37,950,000     7,400,000   59,048,750 

4 Busia 494,609,948 9,262,500                       33,550,000   22,585,560     65,398,060 

5 

Elgeyo/Ma
rakwet 438,967,355 5,947,500     121,025,000                 40,150,000         167,122,500 

6 Embu 432,399,863 6,630,000     104,600,000                     10,237,551     121,467,551 

7 Garissa 969,813,544 10,822,500     142,500,000                       9,620,000   162,942,500 

8 Homa Bay 925,853,896 10,383,750                           12,909,422     23,293,172 

9 Isiolo 311,037,485 6,532,500     142,500,000                       9,620,000   158,652,500 

10 Kajiado 471,830,160 9,896,250                           10,509,643     20,405,893 

11 Kakamega 718,303,924 16,038,750                       33,550,000   24,417,125     74,005,875 

12 Kericho 425,238,177 8,287,500                                 8,287,500 

13 Kiambu 619,767,708 14,527,500                           19,395,531     33,923,031 

14 Kilifi 1,933,698,769 16,087,500                                 16,087,500 

15 Kirinyaga 321,850,768 6,532,500                           13,779,259     20,311,759 

16 Kisii 497,975,162 11,992,500                           21,486,575     33,479,075 

17 Kisumu 712,753,681 10,530,000                           15,407,244     25,937,244 

18 Kitui 572,895,523 13,601,250     121,025,000                           134,626,250 

19 Kwale 1,360,841,563 11,992,500                             6,660,000   18,652,500 

20 Laikipia 113,806,027 6,435,000                                 6,435,000 

21 Lamu 226,554,314 3,997,500                                 3,997,500 

22 Machakos 497,315,830 11,943,750     104,600,000                     12,262,438     128,806,188 

23 Makueni 427,861,686 11,407,500                                 11,407,500 

24 Mandera 394,543,782 15,746,250     142,500,000                           158,246,250 

25 Marsabit 752,548,603 10,432,500     142,500,000                 41,250,000 
462,435,27

0       656,617,770 

26 Meru 632,068,340 12,382,500     104,600,000                     23,306,984     140,289,484 

27 Migori 476,656,818 10,432,500                           13,617,785     24,050,285 

28 Mombasa 1,344,390,789 10,871,250                                 10,871,250 

29 Murang'a 340,120,990 9,701,250                                 9,701,250 

30 Nairobi 443,556,020 24,521,250                             8,950,000   33,471,250 

31 Nakuru 708,709,964 16,136,250                       38,280,000         54,416,250 

32 Nandi 548,601,906 8,238,750                                 8,238,750 

33 Narok 429,841,625 12,382,500                             7,400,000   19,782,500 

34 Nyamira 594,601,640 7,410,000                                 7,410,000 

35 Nyandarua 442,239,423 7,507,500                                 7,507,500 

36 Nyeri 476,036,010 8,336,250                           19,315,146     27,651,396 

37 Samburu 371,327,699 7,117,500     142,500,000                 41,250,000         190,867,500 



  Conditional Additional Allocations from proceeds of loans or grants from Development Partners for Financial Year 2024/25 (Kenya Shillings) 

      FY 2024/25 

S
N 

County  

T
o

ta
l 
L

o
a
n

s 
a
n

d
 G

ra
n

ts
 f

o
r 

F
Y

 

2
0
23

/
24

 

D
A

N
ID

A
 G

ra
n

t 
to

 f
in

a
n

c
e 

P
ri

m
a
ry

 H
e
al

th
 C

a
re

 i
n

 
D

e
vo

lv
e
d

 C
o

n
te

x
t 

ID
A

(W
o

rl
d

 B
a
n

k
) 

- 
K

e
n

y
a 

In
fo

rm
a
l 

S
e
tt

le
m

e
n

t 
Im

p
ro

ve
m

e
n

t 
P

ro
je

c
t-

II
 (

K
IS

IP
 

II
) 

A
F

D
- 

K
e
n

y
a
 I

n
fo

rm
a
l 

S
e
tt

le
m

e
n

t 
Im

p
ro

ve
m

e
n

t 

P
ro

je
c
t-

II
 (

K
IS

IP
 I

I)
 

ID
A

(W
o

rl
d

 B
a
n

k
)-

E
m

e
rg

e
n

cy
 

L
o

c
u

st
 R

e
sp

o
n

se
 

P
ro

je
c
t(

E
L

R
P

) 

K
fW

(G
e
rm

a
n

y 
D

e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
B

a
n

k
) 

lo
a
n

 f
o

r 
 C

o
-F

in
a
n

ci
n

g
 o

f 

F
L

L
o

C
A

 -
C

o
u

n
ty

 C
li

m
a
te

 
R

e
si

li
e
n

c
e 

In
ve

st
m

e
n

t(
C

C
R

I)
G

ra
n

t 
 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
 )

-l
o

a
n

 f
o

r 
th

e
 

F
in

a
n

c
in

g
 o

f 
F

L
L

o
C

A
 -

C
o

u
n

ty
 

C
li

m
a
te

 R
e
si

li
e
n

c
e 

In
ve

st
m

e
n

t(
C

C
R

I)
G

ra
n

t 
 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
) 

L
o

a
n

 f
o

r 
th

e 

F
o

o
d

 S
y
te

m
s 

R
e
si

li
e
n

c
e 

P
ro

je
c
t 

(F
S
R

P
) 

ID
A

 W
o

rl
d

 B
a
n

k
 L

o
a
n

 f
o

r 
th

e
 

N
a
ti

o
n

a
l 

A
g

ri
c
u

lt
u

ra
l 

V
a
lu

e 
C

h
a
in

 D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 

P
ro

je
c
t(

N
A

V
C

D
P

) 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
) 

lo
a
n

 f
o

r 
th

e
 

W
a
te

r 
&

 S
a
n

it
a
ti

o
n

 
D

e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
P

ro
je

c
t 

(W
S
D

P
) 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
)-

K
e
n

y
a
 

D
e
vo

lu
ti

o
n

 S
u

p
p

o
rt

 P
ro

g
ra

m
-I

I 
(K

D
S
P

 I
I)

 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
)C

re
d

it
: 
K

e
n

y
a 

U
rb

a
n

 S
u

p
p

o
rt

 P
ro

je
c
t(

K
U

S
P

)-
U

rb
a
n

 I
n

st
it

u
ti

o
n

a
l 
G

ra
n

t(
U

IG
) 

ID
A

 (
W

o
rl

d
 B

a
n

k
 C

re
d

it
: 
K

e
n

y
a
 

U
rb

a
n

 S
u

p
p

o
rt

 P
ro

je
c
t(

K
U

S
P

)-
 

U
rb

a
n

 D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
G

ra
n

t 
(U

D
G

) 

In
te

rn
a
ti

o
n

a
l 
F

u
n

d
 f

o
r 

A
g

ri
c
u

lt
u

ra
l 

D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t(
IF

A
D

)-
lo

a
n

 f
o

r 
K

e
n

y
a
 L

iv
e
st

o
c
k

 
C

o
m

m
e
rc

ia
li

z
a
ti

o
n

 P
ro

je
c
t 

(K
e
L

C
o

P
) 

K
fW

 (
G

e
rm

a
n

 D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 

B
a
n

k
) 

lo
a
n

 f
o

r 
D

ro
u

g
h

t 
R

e
si

li
e
n

c
e 

P
ro

g
ra

m
m

e
 i

n
 

N
o

rt
h

e
rn

 K
e
n

y
a 

(D
R

P
N

K
) 

In
te

rn
a
ti

o
n

a
l 
F

u
n

d
 f

o
r 

A
g

ri
c
u

lt
u

ra
l 

D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t(
IF

A
D

) 
fo

r 
th

e 
A

q
u

a
c
u

lt
u

re
 B

u
si

n
e
ss

 
D

e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
P

ro
je

c
t 

(A
B

D
P

) 

U
n

it
e
d

 N
a
ti

o
n

s 
F

u
n

d
 F

o
r 

P
o

p
u

la
ti

o
n

 A
c
ti

vi
ti

e
s(

U
N

F
P

A
) 

G
ra

n
t 

- 
10

th
 C

o
u

n
tr

y 
G

ra
n

t 

S
W

E
D

E
N

 -
 K

e
n

y
a
 A

g
ri

c
u

lt
u

ra
l 

B
u

si
n

e
ss

 D
e
ve

lo
p

m
e
n

t 
P

ro
je

c
t 

(K
A

B
D

P
) 

T
o

ta
l 
L

o
a
n

s 
a
n

d
 G

ra
n

ts
 f

o
r 

F
Y

 
2
0
24

/
25

 

    
Colum
n A 

Colu
mn B 

Col
umn 
C 

C
o
l
u
m
n 
D 

Colum
n E 

C
ol
u
m
n 
F 

Col
umn 
G 

Colu
mn 
H 

Colu
mn I 

Colu
mn J 

Colu
mn 
K 

Col
um
n L 

Colu
mn 
M 

Colu
mn 
N 

Col
um
n P 

Colum
n Q 

Column 
R 

Colu
mn S 

Column 
T 

38 Siaya 435,499,920 8,921,250                       33,550,000   13,838,473     56,309,723 

39 Taita Taveta 1,314,783,304 6,532,500                                 6,532,500 

40 Tana River 345,479,159 9,018,750                                 9,018,750 

41 Tharaka Nithi 525,182,222 6,045,000     104,600,000                     12,810,384     123,455,384 

42 Trans Nzoia 797,444,171 8,872,500                       39,050,000         47,922,500 

43 Turkana 987,506,777 16,233,750     142,500,000                   
319,534,14

0   5,920,000   484,187,890 

44 Uasin Gishu 926,935,857 9,750,000                                 9,750,000 

45 Vihiga 392,745,156 7,166,250                                 7,166,250 

46 Wajir 1,173,364,095 13,162,500     142,500,000                           155,662,500 

47 West Pokot 287,043,448 7,702,500     121,025,000                           128,727,500 

  GRAND TOTAL  
29,072,606,66

1 487,500,000 1,700,000,000 1,900,000,000 
2,586,000,000* 
  

905,000,00
0 

1,700,000,0
00 

3,430,000,0
00 

1,478,750,0
00 

1,667,500,000 
  

378,730,00
0 

781,969,41
0 245,879,120 65,190,000 42,000,000 17,368,518,530 

 
 

*Both IDA (World Bank) Loan for the FLLoCA – County Climate Resilience Investment (CCRI) and KfW 
(Germany Development Bank) Loan for Co-Financing of FLLoCA - County Climate Resilience Investment 
(CCRI) Grants are to be allocated among County Governments on the basis of the Criteria in Section 5(4)(a-
d) of the County Government Additional Allocations Act, 2025. 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

.….……../Notices*(Cont’d) 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (437) 

III. THE PUBLIC FINANCE MANAGEMENT 

(AMENDMENT) (NO. 2) BILL (NATIONAL 

ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 26 OF 2024) 

Notice is given that the Chairperson of the Departmental Committee on Finance 
and National Planning intends to move the following amendments to the Public 
Finance Management (Amendment) (No. 2) Bill, 2024 at the Committee Stage— 

NEW CLAUSE 1A 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after clause 1— 

Amendment of section 23 of 
Cap. 412A. 

      1A. The Public Finance Management Act, 
hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”, is 
amended in section 23 by deleting the words “three 
months” appearing in sub-section (1) and substituting 
therefor the words “two months”. 

NEW CLAUSE 1B 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after the proposed new clause 1A— 

Amendment of section 24 of 
Cap. 412A. 

     1B. The principal Act is amended in section 24 (10) 
by deleting the words “three months” appearing in 
paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the words “two 
months”. 

NEW CLAUSE 1C 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after the proposed new clause 1B— 

Amendment of 
section 68 of 
Cap. 412A. 

     1C. The principal Act is amended in section 68— 

(a) in the introductory statement by inserting the words “or 
the Auditor-General under Article 229(7) of the 
Constitution” immediately after the word “Constitution”. 

(b) in subsection (2) by deleting the words “three months” 
appearing in paragraph (k) and substituting therefor the 
words “two months”;  

(c) in subsection (4) (b) by inserting the words” Auditor 
General” immediately after the word “national Treasury”; 
and 

(d) by inserting the following subsection immediately after 
sub-section (4) — 

“(4A) An accounting officer who does not implement the 
recommendations made under sub-section (4) shall be 
liable to the penalty provided for under section 199.” 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (438) 
 
NEW CLAUSE 1D 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after the proposed new clause 1C— 

Amendment of section 80 of 
Cap. 412A. 

     1D. The principal Act is amended in section 80 by 
deleting the words “four months” appearing in 
subsection (4) and substituting therefor the words “two 
months”. 

NEW CLAUSE 1E 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after the proposed new clause 1D— 

Amendment of section 81 of 
Cap. 412A. 

     1E. The principal Act is amended in section 81 by 
deleting the words “three months” appearing in 
subsection (4) and substituting the words “two 
months”. 

NEW CLAUSE 1F 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after the proposed new clause 1E— 

Amendment of section 84 of 

Cap. 412A. 
     1F. The principal Act is amended in section 82 — 

(a) by deleting the words “three months” appearing 
in subsection (3) and substituting therefor the 
words “two months”; and 

(b) by deleting the words “three months” appearing 
in subsection (4) and substituting the words 
“two months”. 

NEW CLAUSE 1G 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after the proposed new clause 1F— 

Amendment of section 115 of 
Cap. 412A. 

     1G. The principal Act is amended in section 115 by 
deleting the words “three months” appearing in 
subsection (1) and substituting therefor the words “two 
months”. 

NEW CLAUSE 1H 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after the proposed new clause 1G— 

Amendment of section 116 of 
Cap. 412A. 

     1H. The principal Act is amended in section 116 (7) 
by deleting the words “three months” appearing in 
paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the words “two 
months”. 

 
 
 
 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (439) 
 
CLAUSE 2 
THAT, clause 2 of the Bill be amended by deleting the words “Public Finance 
Management Act, (in this Act referred to as “the principal Act”),” and substituting 
therefor the words “principal Act”. 

CLAUSE 3 
THAT, clause 3 of the Bill be amended in the proposed new section 131A (4)— 
 
(a)  by inserting the following new paragraph immediately after paragraph (b)— 
 

“(ba) be open and accountable, including public participation;” 
 

(b) in paragraph (f)— 
(i) by deleting the word “arrangements” appearing immediately after the words “and 

other tariff” and substituting therefor the word “agreements”; and 
(ii) by deleting the word “arrangements” appearing immediately after the words 

“taxation and tariff” and substituting therefor the word “agreements”. 
 
NEW CLAUSE 4A 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clauses immediately 
after clause 4— 
 

Amendment of section 149 of Cap. 
412A. 

     4A. The principal Act is amended in section 
149—  

 (a) in the introductory statement by inserting 
the words “or the Auditor-General under 
Article 229(7) of the Constitution” 
immediately after the word “Constitution”; 

(b) in subsection (2) by deleting the words 
“three months” appearing in paragraph (k) 
and substituting therefor the words “two 
months”; 

(c) in subsection (3) by deleting paragraph (b) 
and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 
“(b)submit the report to the county 
assembly with a copy to the County 
Treasury, Controller of Budget and Auditor-
General.” 

(d) by inserting the following new subsection 
immediately after subsection (3)— 
“(3A) An accounting officer who does not 
implement the recommendations made 
under subsection (3) shall be liable to the 
penalty provided for under section 199.” 

 
 
 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (440) 
NEW CLAUSE 4B 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clauses immediately 
after clause 4A— 
 
 

Amendment of section 163 of Cap. 
412A. 

     4B. The principal Act is amended in section 163 
by deleting the words “four months” appearing in 
subsection (4) and substituting therefor the words 
“two months”. 

 
NEW CLAUSE 4C 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clauses immediately 
after clause 4B— 
 
 

Amendment of section 164 of Cap. 
412A. 

     4C. The principal Act is amended in section 164 
by deleting the words “three months” appearing in 
subsection (4) and substituting therefor the words 
“two months”. 

 
 
NEW CLAUSE 4C 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clauses immediately 
after clause 4B— 
 
 

Amendment of section 165 of Cap. 
412A. 

     4D. The principal Act is amended in section 
165 by deleting the words “three months” 
appearing in subsection (3) and substituting 
therefor the words “two months”. 

 
NEW CLAUSE 4E 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clauses immediately 
after clause 4D— 
 
 

Amendment of section 167 of Cap. 
412A. 

     4E. The principal Act is amended in section 
167 by deleting the words “three months” 
appearing in subsection (3) and substituting 
therefor the words “two months”. 

 
 
NEW CLAUSE 4F 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clauses immediately 
after clause 4E— 
 
 
 
 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (441) 

Amendment of 
section 192 of Cap. 
412A. 

     4F. The principal Act is amended by deleting section 192 
and substituting therefor the following new section— 
 

 Establishment of the Board. 192. (1) There is established a board 
to be known as the Public Sector 
Accounting Standards Board. 

 

  (2) The Board shall be a body 
corporate with perpetual succession and 
a common seal, and shall in its corporate 
name, be capable of— 

 

  (a) suing and being sued; 

(b) taking, purchasing or otherwise 
acquiring, borrowing, holding, 
charging or disposing of movable 
and immovable property; and 

(c) doing or performing all such 
other things or acts necessary for 
the proper performance of its 
functions which may lawfully be 
done by a body corporate. 

 

  (3) The Board shall be a successor of the 
Accounting Standards Board which 
existed immediately before the 
commencement of this Act. 

 
NEW CLAUSE 4G 
 

THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clauses immediately 
after clause 4F— 
 

Amendment of section 193 of Cap. 
412A. 

      4G. The principal Act is amended in section 
193 by deleting subsection (5). 

 
 
 
NEW CLAUSE 4H 
 

THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after clause 4G— 
 
 
 
 
 
 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (442) 
 

Insertion of new section 
in Cap. 412A. 

      4H. The principal Act is amended by inserting the 
following new sections immediately after section 195— 

 Chief executive 
officer. 

195A. (1) The Public Sector Accounting 
Standards Board shall appoint a chief executive 
officer through a competitive process and, on 
such terms and conditions as it may determine. 

  (2) A person shall be qualified for 
appointment as a chief executive officer, if the 
person— 

  (a) has a degree in accounting, economics, 
finance or related field from a university 
recognized in Kenya; 

(b) is a certified member in good standing 
with the professional body regulating 
accountants; 

(c) has at least ten years knowledge and 
experience in the relevant field; 

(d) has served in a position of senior 
management for a period of at least five 
years; and 

(e) meets the requirements of chapter six of 
the constitution. 

  (3) The chief executive officer shall hold 
office for a period of four years but shall be 
eligible for reappointment for a further term of 
four years.  

  (4) The chief executive officer shall, subject to 
the general direction and control of the Board, 
be charged with the direction of the affairs and 
transactions of the Board, the exercise, 
discharge and performance of its objectives, 
functions and duties, and the administration 
and control of the staff of the Board. 

 Staff of the 

Board. 
195B. (1) The Public Sector Accounting 

Standards Board may recruit such number of 
staff, through a competitive process, as may be 
necessary for the proper and efficient 
performance of the functions of the Board. 

   (2) The Public Service Commission may, on 
the request of the Board, second to the board 
such number of public officers as may be 
necessary for the performance of the functions 
of the Board. 

 

 



(No. 20)    THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025        (443) 

 Common seal. 195C. (1) The common seal of the Board 
shall be kept in such custody as the Board shall 
direct and shall not be used except on the order 
of the Board. 

  (2) The affixing of the common seal shall be 
authenticated by the chairperson or any other 
person authorized in that behalf by a resolution 
of the Board. 

  (3) The common seal of the Board when 
affixed to a document and duly authenticated 
shall be judicially and officially noticed and 
unless the contrary is proved, any necessary 
order or authorization of the Board under this 
section shall be presumed to have been duly 
given. 

 Funds of the 
Board. 

195D. The funds of the Board shall consist 
of— 

  (a) such monies as may be appropriated 
by the National Assembly; 

(b) such moneys as may be imposed by 
the Board in the performance of its 
functions; or 

(c) such grants, donations or 
endowment received by the Board. 

 Financial year.          195E. The financial year of the Board 
shall be the period of twelve months ending on 
the thirtieth of June in each year. 

 Annual 
estimates. 

195F. (1) Before the commencement of 
each financial year, the Board shall cause to be 
prepared estimates of the revenue and 
expenditure of the Board for that year. 

  (2) The annual estimates shall make 
provision for all the estimated expenditure of 
the Board for the financial year concerned and, 
in particular, shall provide for the— 

  (a) payment of the salaries, allowances and 
other charges in respect of the staff of 
the Board; 

(b) payment of pensions, gratuities and 
other charges and in respect of benefits 
which are payable out of the funds of 
the Board; 

(c) maintenance of the buildings and 
grounds of the Board; 



(No.20)  THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025     (444) 

(d) creation of such funds to meet future or 
contingent liabilities in respect of 
benefits, insurance or replacement of 
buildings or installations, equipment 
and in respect of such other matters as 
the Board may think fit. 

  (3) The annual estimates shall be approved 
by the Board before the commencement of the 
financial year to which they relate and shall be 
submitted to the Cabinet Secretary for tabling 
in the National Assembly. 

  (4) No expenditure shall be incurred for 
the purposes of the Board except in accordance 
with the annual estimates approved under 
subsection (3). 

 Accounts and 
audits. 

195G. (1) The Board shall cause to be kept 
all proper books and records of accounts of the 
income, expenditure, assets and liabilities of the 
Board. 

  (2) Within a period of two months after the 
end of each financial year, the Board shall 
submit to the Auditor-General the accounts of 
the Board in respect of that year together with 
a— 

  (a) statement of the income and 
expenditure of the Board during that 
year; and 

(b) statement of the assets and liabilities of 
the Board on the last day of that 
financial year. 

  

 

 

 

 

Cap. 412B. 

(3) The annual accounts of the Board shall 
be prepared, audited and reported upon 
in accordance with the provisions of 
Articles 226 and 229 of the 
Constitution and the Public Audit Act. 

 
NEW CLAUSE 4I 
THAT, the principal Act be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately 
after clause 4H— 
 

Amendment of the Second Schedule to 
Cap. 412A. 

        4H. The Second Schedule to the principal 
Act is amended by inserting the following 
paragraphs immediately after paragraph 16— 

 

 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025        (445) 

 17. All the rights, duties, obligations, assets 
and liabilities of the Public Sector Accounting 
Standards Board existing at the commencement of 
this Act shall be automatically and fully transferred 
to the Board. 

 18. The administrative directions made by the 
former Public Sector Accounting Standards Board 
or by the Cabinet Secretary which were in force 
immediately before the commencement of this Act 
shall have force as if they were directions made by 
the Board or the Cabinet Secretary under this Act. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

……../Notices* 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (446) 
 

IV. THE INSURANCE PROFESSIONALS BILL 

(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 13 OF 2024) 

Notice is given that the Chairperson of the Departmental Committee on Finance 
and National Planning intends to move the following amendments to the 
Insurance Professionals Bill, 2024 at the Committee Stage— 

CLAUSE 2 
THAT, Clause 2 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting the definition “insurance consultant”; 
(b) by deleting the definition “managing agent”. 

 
CLAUSE 4 
THAT, Clause 4 of the Bill be amended— 

(a)  by deleting subclause (1) and substituting therefor the following new subclause— 
“(1) The membership of the Institute shall comprise individuals who have been 
registered in accordance with this Act.” 

(b) by deleting subclause (2) and substituting therefor the following new subclause— 
“(2) The Members of the Institute shall be classified into the following 
categories— 
(a) Fellows, comprising those persons who are Fellows of the Insurance Institute 

of Kenya, or Fellows of the Chartered Insurance Institute of London or 
Fellows of any other insurance institute recognized in Kenya; 

(b) Associate Members, comprising those persons who are Associate Members of 
the Insurance Institute of Kenya, or Associate Members of the Chartered 
Insurance Institute of London, or Associate Members of any other insurance 
institute recognised in Kenya; 

(c) Affiliate Members, comprising those members who work in the insurance 
industry but are not insurance professionals including accountants, lawyers and 
members of other professional bodies; and 

(d) Corporate Members, comprising private and public institutions and 
organisation including companies, partnerships and other corporate bodies. 

(c) in subclause (3) by deleting the word “Institution” and substituting therefor the 
word “Institute”. 

CLAUSE 5 
THAT, Clause 5 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by deleting paragraph (f); 
(b) by deleting paragraph (g). 

 
CLAUSE 6 
THAT, Clause 6 of the Bill be amended— 

(a) by renumbering paragraphs (b), (c), (d), (e), (f) as (a), (b), (c), (d), (e); 
(b) in renumbered paragraph (b) by deleting the word “nine” and substituting therefor 

the word “seven”. 
 
 
 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (447) 
 
CLAUSE 10 
 

THAT, Clause 10 of the Bill is amended by deleting subclause (5) and substituting 
therefor the following new subclause— 
“(5) A person is qualified for appointment as the Executive Director to the Institute if 
the person— 

(a) is a registered insurance professional; 
(b) holds a degree in the relevant field from a university recognized in Kenya; 
(c) has at least ten years knowledge and experience in the relevant field; 
(d) has served in a position of senior management for a period of at least five years; 

and 
(e) meets the requirements of Chapter six of the Constitution.” 

 
CLAUSE 15 
 

THAT, Clause 15 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by deleting the words “and 
who shall serve under the direction and control of the Executive Director”. 
 
CLAUSE 17 
 

THAT, Clause 17 of the Bill be amended— 
(a)  in subclause (1)— 

(i) by deleting paragraph (d) and substituting therefor the following new 
paragraph— 

“(d) a nominee from the Association of Kenya Insurers who must be an insurance 
professional nominated in writing;” 
(ii) by deleting paragraph (e) and substituting therefor the following new 

paragraph— 
“(e) a nominee from the Association of Insurance Brokers of Kenya who shall be 
an insurance professional nominated in writing;” 
(iii) by deleting paragraph (f) and substituting therefor the following new 

paragraph— 
“(f) one person nominated by the Council from amongst the members of the 
Institute;” 
(iv) by inserting the following new paragraphs immediately after paragraph 

(f)— 
“(g) one person nominated by the Insurance Training and Education Trust; 
(h) one person nominated by the recognized insurance training institutions who 
are members of the Institute.” 

(b) In subclause (2) by deleting the words “and (f)” and substituting therefor the 
words “,(f), (g) and (h)”. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (448) 
 
 
NEW CLAUSE 37A 
THAT, the Bill be amended by inserting the following new clause immediately after 
clause 37— 

Funds of the 
Examination Board. 

       37A. The funds of the Examinations Board shall consist 
of— 

 (a) monies allocated to the Board from the subscription 
fees paid to the Institute; 

(b) examination fees levied by the Institute against any 
person who applies to sit for an examination 
administered by the Examinations Board; 

(c) donations, gifts and endowments from lawful sources; 
and 

(d) grants. 
 
CLAUSE 20 
THAT, Clause 20 of the Bill be amended by deleting paragraph (e). 
 
CLAUSE 24 
THAT, Clause 24 of the Bill be amended in subclause (4) by deleting the words “to a 
fine not exceeding fifty thousand shillings or to imprisonment for a period not exceeding 
six months or to both” and substituting therefor the words “to a fine not exceeding one 
hundred thousand shillings or to imprisonment for period not exceeding six months or 
to both”. 
 
CLAUSE 25 
THAT, Clause 25 of the Bill be amended in subclause (1) by deleting paragraph (c). 
 
CLAUSE 28 
THAT, Clause 28 be amended in subclause (1) by inserting the following new paragraph 
immediately after paragraph (b)— 
“(c) at the member’s request.” 
 
CLAUSE 30 
THAT, Clause 30 of the Bill be amended— 

(a)  in subclause (1)— 
(i) in paragraph (m) by inserting the words “or whose membership to the 

Institute has been cancelled” immediately after the words “practising 
certificate”; 

(ii) by inserting the following new paragraph immediately after paragraph (o)— 
“(oa” is found guilty of professional misconduct by the Insurance 
Regulatory Authority;” 

(b) by inserting the following new subclause immediately after subclause (1)— 
“(1A) Subclause (1) (m) shall not apply to insurance professionals who receive 
business from foreign insurance professionals.” 

 
CLAUSE 34 
THAT, clause 34 of the Bill be deleted. 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (449) 
 
CLAUSE 40 
THAT, Clause 40 of the Bill be amended by inserting the following new subclause 
immediately after subclause (2)— 
“(3) The Cabinet Secretary, in consultation with the Institute, shall, in the notice under 
subsection (1), prescribe the procedure for obtaining a practising certificate to be 
followed by insurance professionals who were in practice on the date of the 
commencement of this Act.” 
 
FIRST SCHEDULE 
THAT, the First Schedule to the Bill be amended in paragraph (3) by deleting the words 
“two years” and substituting therefor the words “three years”. 
 
FOURTH SCHEDULE 
THAT, the Fourth Schedule to the Bill be amended in paragraph (8) by deleting 
subparagraph (2). 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

.….……../Notices* 



(No. 20)         THURSDAY, MARCH 13, 2025           (450) 

 
The House resolved on Thursday, February 13, 2025 as follows- 

 

Limitation of Debate on Motions 

V. THAT, each speech in a debate on any Motion, including a Special motion be 
limited in the following manner: A maximum of three hours with not more than twenty 
(20) minutes for the Mover and ten (10) minutes for each other Member speaking, 
except the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party, who shall 
be limited to a maximum of fifteen (15) minutes each, and that ten (10) minutes before 
the expiry of the time, the Mover be called upon to reply; and that priority in speaking 
be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party, the Leader of the Minority Party and 
the Chairperson of the relevant Departmental Committee, in that order. 

 

Limitation of Debate on Other Committee Reports 

VI. THAT, each speech in a debate on Other Committee Reports, including a Report of 
a Joint Committee of the Houses of Parliament or any other Report submitted to the 
House for which limitation of time has not been specified,  be limited as follows:- A 
maximum of two and a half hours, with not more than twenty (20) minutes for the 
Mover in moving and five (5) minutes for any other Member speaking, including the 
Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party and the Chairperson 
of the relevant Committee (if the Committee Report is not moved by the Chairperson 
of the relevant Committee), and that ten (10) minutes before the expiry of the time,  the 
Mover shall be called upon to reply; and further that priority in speaking shall be 
accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party and the Leader of the Minority Party, in 
that order. 
 

Limitation of Debate on Bills sponsored by Parties or Committees 
 

VII. THAT, each speech in a debate on Bills sponsored by a Committee, the Leader of 
the Majority Party or the Leader of the Minority Party be limited as follows:- A 
maximum of forty five (45) minutes for the Mover, in moving and fifteen minutes (15) 
in replying, a maximum of thirty (30) minutes for the Chairperson of the relevant 
Committee (if the Bill is not sponsored by the relevant Committee), and a maximum of 
ten (10) minutes for any other Member speaking, except the Leader of the Majority Party 
and the Leader of the Minority Party, who shall be limited to a maximum of fifteen 
minutes (15) each (if the Bill is not sponsored by either of them); and that priority in 
speaking be accorded to the Leader of the Majority Party, the Leader of the Minority 
Party and the Chairperson of the relevant Departmental Committee, in that order. 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

............/Notice Paper* 



NOTICE PAPER 

 

Tentative business for  
 

Friday (Morning), March 14, 2025 

(Published pursuant to Standing Order 38(1)) 
 

 

It is notified that the following business is tentatively scheduled to appear in the Order 
Paper for Friday (Morning), March 14, 2025— 

 

A. THE DIVISION OF REVENUE BILL, 2025 
 (The Chairperson, Liaison Committee) 

     First Reading 
 

B. MOTION – PUBLIC PETITION ON LEGAL RECOGNITION AND  
   PROTECTION OF E-HAILING MOTORCYCLE RIDERS 
   AND DELIVERY PERSONNEL 

(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Transport and 
Infrastructure) 
 

(If not concluded on Thursday, March 13, 2025 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 
C. THE BASIC EDUCATION (AMENDMENT) BILL (NATIONAL 

ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 59 OF 2023) 
    (The Hon. Mary Wamaua, M.P.) 

      Second Reading 
 

    

D. MOTION: 007/2024 – IMPLEMENTATION OF THE UNIVERSAL  
     HEALTH COVERAGE AND OF A POLICY ON 
     MANDATORY USE OF PUBLIC HEALTH CARE 
     FACILITIES BY PUBLIC OFFICERS 

            (The Hon. Sabina Chege, M.P.) 

 
E. MOTION – STATE OF SECURITY IN SIX COUNTIES OF NORTH RIFT 

   BEING, BARINGO, ELGEYO MARAKWET, TURKANA,  
 WEST POKOT, SAMBURU AND LAIKIPIA 

(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Administration and 
 Internal Security) 

 

 (If not concluded on Thursday, March 13, 2025 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 

F. THE LEARNERS WITH DISABILITIES BILL (SENATE BILL NO. 4 OF 
2023) 
(The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Education) 

 

      Second Reading 
 

 (If not concluded on Thursday, March 13, 2025 – Afternoon Sitting) 

 

 



G. THE TREATY MAKING AND RATIFICATION (AMENDMENT) (No.2) 
BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 9 OF 2024) 

    (The Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs) 
 

      Second Reading 
 

 (If not concluded on Thursday, March 13, 2025– Afternoon Sitting) 

 

H. ADJOURNMENT OF THE HOUSE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE 
CALENDAR 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

........./Appendix* 



APPENDIX 

NOTICE OF PETITIONS, QUESTIONS & 

STATEMENTS 
 

ORDER NO. 4 - PETITIONS 

It is notified that, pursuant to the provisions of Standing Order 225, the following 

Petition will be presented –  
 

No.  Subject   Petitioner(s)  Relevant 

Committee 

 

06/2025 Persistent harassment and 

unlawful eviction of people 

living on L.R. No. 

176/111/MN in Mwendo wa 

Panya Village, Mtepeni Ward 

in Kilifi South Constituency 

 

To be presented by the Hon. 

Ken Chonga, MP (Kilifi 

South), on behalf of 

concerned residents of 

Mwendo wa Panya Village 

 

Public Petitions 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
........./Appendix*(Cont’d) 



ORDER NO. 7 - STATEMENTS 

It is notified that, pursuant to the provisions of Standing Order 44(2)(c), the 

following Statement will be requested— 

 

No. Subject   Member Relevant Committee 

1.  Implementation of the Career 

Progression Guidelines for 

teachers 

 

Hon. Joseph Gitari, MP 

(Kirinyaga Central)  

 

Education 

 

 

 

 

 

 


